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Executive summary

As global populations age, governments around the world are 
investigating how to fund long-term care (LTC) in an equitable and 
sustainable manner. The research reported here has three objectives: 
(i) to identify and classify middle-income countries (MICs) and high-
income countries (HICs) that have established LTC for older 
populations; (ii) to describe the financing features and undertake a 
detailed assessment of the public LTC programmes in these 
countries; and (iii) to identify and discuss the benefits, disadvantages 
and challenges of the different public LTC financing strategies, based 
on the experiences of high-income countries and on observations of 
the reviewed countries.

The public LTC financing system of 13 countries is reviewed: five 
HICs (Australia, Japan, Netherlands (Kingdom of the), Singapore and 
Uruguay), and eight MICs (China, Costa Rica, India, Indonesia, 
Malaysia, Serbia, South Africa and Thailand). Although information on 
LTC expenditure is not consistently reported or available for all 
countries, the 13 reviewed countries vary considerably in terms of 
their national income, total spending on health and public share of 
health care spending. Among the reviewed HICs, public spending on 
LTC reflects the financing strategies of each country; total public 
spending on LTC is highest in Japan and lowest in Singapore. Public 
LTC spending is very small in the studied MICs. For example, in Costa 
Rica and Thailand, public spending on LTC amounts to 0.05 and 
0.01% of gross domestic product (GDP), respectively.

The eight MICs studied vary significantly in how they finance LTC, 
although these methods can be classified within two broad 
categories. China, Costa Rica, Serbia and Thailand use a mixture of 
limited or small-scale universal public LTC programmes that are 
combined with means-tested programmes. In India, Indonesia, 
Malaysia and South Africa, public LTC programmes are predominantly 
means tested and delivered by the social welfare system. Overall, 
while both universal and mean-tested programmes target older 
populations, many of the programmes operate within the social 
welfare system rather than as a separate LTC system. 

There are three major types of public LTC programmes in the 
reviewed MICs: (i) the government either directly provides LTC 
services or else finances LTC through supply-side financing (e.g. 
operational grants) or demand-directed funding; (ii) cash allowance 
programmes that disburse monetary allowance to beneficiaries; and 
(iii) insurance-based models of public LTC financing (the approach 
China has taken in its ongoing long-term care insurance pilot 
programmes). 

Approaches to publicly financing LTC services across these three 
types of programmes vary between countries, depending on how 
public funds are organized and allocated as well as the extent of 
coverage for people in need of LTC. In designing their public LTC 
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financing systems, countries need to take into account several 
important considerations, including whether governments should 
means-test eligibility or offer universal coverage, whether 
governments should provide services directly or instead act as an 
insurer or third-party payer, whether the financing should be 
structured nationally (centralized) or locally (decentralized), and the 
degree to which the financing of LTC should be separate from that of 
medical care services. How countries choose to finance LTC will have 
significant implications on equity and fairness, access, financial 
protection, affordability and sustainability. It is important that these 
factors are carefully considered when designing LTC financing 
systems to ensure that the well-being of individuals and their 
families are maximized. 

This report concludes with some deliberations and lessons learned 
on financing options for LTC, specifically for low- and middle-income 
countries. Overall, the report offers valuable insights into how 
policy-makers can design effective and sustainable public LTC 
financing systems, ensuring that individuals and their families 
receive the necessary support and assistance to lead dignified lives 
as they age.



1 

Background 
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There is a growing recognition of the need for formal mechanisms to 
finance LTC for older people (those aged either ≥ 60 or ≥ 65 years, 
depending on the specific policies of a particular country) (1) to 
complement the provision of informal care, which is becoming 
increasingly strained in many countries. The potentially high 
financial burden, resulting from uncertainties surrounding the 
duration and type of care required (2), has prompted calls for public 
financing mechanisms for LTC (3). Formal systems to publicly finance 
LTC have been established to meet this need in some HICs. Although 
these financing arrangements differ between countries in their exact 
design, they commonly comprise universal programmes through 
direct government financing and mandatory social health insurance, 
as well as means-tested programmes targeted at those with greater 
need (3).

Low- and middle-income countries (LMICs) are confronted with 
specific challenges that limit their ability to publicly finance LTC 
services. Compared with HICs, LMICs generally have low tax 
revenues and therefore limited fiscal capacity to support public LTC 
programmes (4). In addition, there are competing priorities (5) in 
areas such as infrastructure (e.g. building of roads), education, 
military and defence, and health. These competing priorities may 
further restrict the financial resources that can be allocated to LTC. 
Governments in LMICs often also have limited capacity for designing 
and operating public programmes (6). For example, in the health care 
sector, many LMICs have limited health infrastructure, a low-skilled 
health care workforce, and poor capacity for management and 
governance. These challenges are similarly pertinent to the LTC 
sector, resulting in a lack of specialized infrastructure, facilities and 
equipment, and a lack of skilled care managers, workers and 
caregivers.

On a societal level (7), these challenges are likely compounded by a 
lack of awareness of the function of and need for LTC, which in turn 
results in low political and public support for publicly financed LTC 
services. Cultural norms can further impede the acceptance of 
formal LTC and its place in society, as they are stigmatized or viewed 
as unnecessary. For example, placing an older parent in a residential 
LTC facility may be perceived as a dereliction of filial responsibility 
in some cultures (8), leading to a reluctance to utilize such services.

It is within these broad contexts that this research seeks to 
contribute. The overarching objective of this project is to contribute 
to the development of policy recommendations on public LTC 
financing programmes for individuals from all socioeconomic 
backgrounds. This objective is achieved by compiling evidence of 
and information about how countries finance LTC, and analysing this 
evidence in terms of the implications of these financing choices for 
the coverage, quality, financial protection and financial sustainability 
of LTC. 
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This report is organized as follows. In Chapter 2, the objectives and 
methods of this study are described, and the MICs and HICs that 
have some established LTC programmes for older populations are 
identified and classified. In Chapters 3–5, the financing of these 
programmes is described and the three types of public LTC 
programmes are assessed in detail. In Chapter 3, programmes for 
which the government either directly provides, or finances, LTC 
services are reviewed. Cash allowance programmes are described in 
Chapter 4, which are a common form of social welfare payment in 
the reviewed countries. In Section 5, the financing of LTC using 
mandatory social insurance is discussed and the long-term care 
insurance (LTCI) pilots in China are reviewed. A discussion of the 
advantages, disadvantages and challenges of the surveyed public 
LTC financing strategies is provided in Chapter 6, and some lessons 
learned for LMICs are offered in Chapter 7. 





2 

Classifying LTC 
financing systems
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2.1  Study objectives and methods

This work began by reviewing the published and grey literature to 
identify MICs and HICs that have, to varying degrees, established LTC 
programmes for their older populations. Substantial work already 
exists for HICs (9,10), where publicly accessible and up-to-date 
information is readily available (11). Many LMICs do not have an 
established LTC system (an important criterion determining inclusion 
in this assessment), have limited public financing and rely 
predominantly on private financing (12). There is also much less 
information and systematic data collection on LTC programmes in 
LMICs (12). Data from the WHO Maternal, newborn, child and 
adolescent health and ageing dataset (13) were used to identify 
countries that have an LTC policy, plan or strategy.

A key challenge in identifying countries among LMICs for inclusion 
was that publicly financed LTC programmes in many countries are 
either small and still developing, or are non-existent. For HICs, and 
especially MICs, reviewed countries are limited to those that have 
either well established LTC systems, or where some organized LTC 
programmes currently exist. In accordance with the classification of 
public LTC financing systems proposed by Colombo et al. (3), MICs 
that have some form of universal and means-tested LTC systems that 
are financed by governments are focused on. Where universal public 
programmes for LTC exist in MICs, they are often of limited scope 
and small in scale; these definitions are described further in 
Chapters 3–5. Although both universal and means-tested 
programmes target the older population, many of the programmes 
operate within the social welfare system rather than as a distinct LTC 
system. 

The public LTC financing systems of 13 countries that have some 
form of publicly financed LTC programme are reviewed in this 
document: five HICs covering four major geographical regions 
(Australia, Japan, Netherlands (Kingdom of the), Singapore and 
Uruguay), and eight upper- and lower-middle-income countries 
(China, Costa Rica, India, Indonesia, Malaysia, Serbia, South Africa 
and Thailand). Low-income countries (LICs) are excluded from the 
analysis because formal LTC programmes are absent from the policy 
agendas of nearly all LICs (14); given their younger populations 
relative to MICs and HICs, population ageing is less of an issue. This 
selection provides a broad geographical coverage with an emphasis 
on countries within the WHO South-East Asia Region and Western 
Pacific Region, which contain more than one third of the world’s 
older population (15).

Colombo et al. (3) categorizes countries based on two main LTC 
financing criteria: (i) scope of entitlement, that is, whether publicly 
funded LTC benefits are universal or means tested; and (ii) whether 
LTC coverage is achieved through single or multiple programmes, 
benefits and services. Where applicable, countries can be further 
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classified based on sources of funding (earmarked tax, general 
revenue) for their LTC programme, and whether the programme is 
situated within or separately from their health system. 

2.2  Overview of included countries

A summary of key indicators describing public spending on health 
and LTC, as well as relevant demographic data, for the 13 included 
countries is presented in Table 2.1 (10,16–25). These countries vary 
considerably in terms of their national income, total spending on 
health and public share of health care spending. Although the 
emphasis of this report is on public financing of LTC, health 
expenditure is also discussed as it provides an indication of the 
availability of resources for, and also the priority placed on, health 
and social programmes. How countries choose to finance health 
expenditure provides useful contextual information; some reviewed 
countries adopt similar mechanisms to finance LTC and health care. 

Among HICs, public expenditure on health reflects country fiscal 
capacity, financing strategies and public priorities on health. Public 
expenditure on health as a share of GDP is highest in Japan (9.2%), 
followed by Australia (8.0%), Netherlands (Kingdom of the) (7.7%), 
Uruguay (6.6%) and Singapore (3.2%) (17). Japan and Uruguay have 
a social-insurance-style health financing system combined with 
government contributions, whereas Netherlands (Kingdom of the) 
has mandated universal private health insurance with voluntary 
complementary health insurance. Australia has a universal-tax-
financed health insurance system combined with private insurance, 
whereas Singapore relies on direct government subsidies, medical 
savings accounts and risk-pooled funds for catastrophic health 
spending. These HICs have greater fiscal space for health and other 
public programmes as a result of the larger size of their economies 
and tax base. Government spending accounts for nearly half of the 
national income in Australia, Japan and Netherlands (Kingdom of the).

Government spending on health in included MICs is considerably 
lower compared with that in HICs. Public health expenditure as a 
share of GDP is highest in Costa Rica (5.6%), followed by Serbia 
(5.3%), South Africa (5.3%), China (3.1%), Thailand (3.1%), Malaysia 
(2.2%), Indonesia (1.9%) and India (1.1%) (17). The large variations in 
public and total spending on health reflect the heterogeneity in the 
approach by countries to finance health care and the broader fiscal 
environment. China, Costa Rica and Serbia finance health care 
predominantly through social health insurance. In Malaysia, South 
Africa and Thailand, health care is funded mainly through general 
taxation. In Indonesia, health care is financed through general 
taxation and social health insurance contributions. In India, out-of-
pocket user payments account for half of total spending on health.
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Table 2.1. Summary of middle- and high-income countries reviewed for their financing of LTC

Country

GDP per 
capita  
(US$/PPP) 
(16)

Current 
health 
expenditure 
(% of GDP) 
(17)

General 
government 
expenditure 
(GGE)  
(% of GDP) 
(17)

Domestic 
general 
government 
health 
expenditure 
(% of GDP) 
(17)

Domestic 
general 
government 
health 
expenditure 
(% of GGE)a 
(17)

Total 
expenditure 
on LTC  
(% of GDP)

Public 
expenditure 
on LTC  
(% of GDP)

Population 
aged ≥ 65 
years in 
2021 (2040)
b (%) (18)

Life 
expectancy 
at 65 years 
(women/
men)

Australia 59 934 10.6 46.6 8.0 17.2 1.1 (2019) 
(19)

1.1 (2019) 
(19)

16.6 (21.9) 23.0/20.3 
(2020) (19)

China 12 556 5.6 36.4 3.1 8.4 NR < 0.1 (2010) 
(20)

13.1 (26.2) NR

Costa Rica 12 509 7.9 22.4 5.6 25.2 0.05 (2020) 
(17)

0.05 (2020) 
(17)

10.5 (18.7) 21.5/18.9 
(21)

India 2 277 3.0 32.7 1.1 3.3 < 0.001 
(2018) (17)

< 0.001 
(2018) (17) 

6.8 (11.6) NR

Indonesia 4 292 3.4 18.6 1.9 10.1 NR NR 6.8 (12.0) NR

Japan 39 285 10.9 44.5 9.2 20.6 2.0 (2020) 
(19)

< 1.0 (2020) 
(10)

29.8 (35.2) 24.9/20.1 
(21)

Malaysia 11 371 4.1 25.3 2.2 8.6 < 0.001 
(2019) (17)

< 0.001 
(2019) (17)

7.3 (13.0) NR

Netherlands 
(Kingdom of 
the)

58 061 11.1 47.6 7.7 16.1 3.2 (2020) 
(19)

3.0 (2020) 
(19)

20.0 (26.8) 20.8/18.4 
(2021) (19)

Serbia 9 215 8.7 48.2 5.3 11.0 0.5 (2016) 
(22)

<1.0 (2015) 
(22)

20.7 (25.8) NR
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Country

GDP per 
capita  
(US$/PPP) 
(16)

Current 
health 
expenditure 
(% of GDP) 
(17)

General 
government 
expenditure 
(GGE)  
(% of GDP) 
(17)

Domestic 
general 
government 
health 
expenditure 
(% of GDP) 
(17)

Domestic 
general 
government 
health 
expenditure 
(% of GGE)a 
(17)

Total 
expenditure 
on LTC  
(% of GDP)

Public 
expenditure 
on LTC  
(% of GDP)

Population 
aged ≥ 65 
years in 
2021 (2040)
b (%) (18)

Life 
expectancy 
at 65 years 
(women/
men)

Singapore 72 794 6.1 23.9 3.2 13.3 NR NR 14.1 (29.8) 19.3/23.0 
(2021) (23)

South Africa 14 624 8.6 34.9 5.3 15.3 0.01 (2019) 
(17)

0.004 (2019) 
(17)

6.0 (8.9) 14.7/11.5 
(2021) (24)

Thailand 7 233 4.4 23.2 3.1 13.2 0.01 (2020) 
(17)

0.01 (2020) 
(17)

14.5 (27.4) NR

Uruguay 17 313 9.2 32.8 6.6 20.0 0.15 (2020) 
(17)

0.06 (2019) 
(25)

15.5 (20.2) NR

GDP: gross domestic product; GGE: general government expenditure; LTC: long-term care; NR: not reported; PPP: purchasing power parity;  
US$: United States dollars.

a Calculated from the original data before rounding for inclusion in this table. 

b 2021 statistics based on estimates; 2040 data according to medium fertility variants (18).



10	 �Public provision and financing of long-term care: case studies in middle- and  
high-income countries 

In terms of population ageing and LTC expenditure, the populations 
of Japan (29.8%), Serbia (20.7%), Netherlands (Kingdom of the) 
(20.0%) and Australia (16.6%) have the highest concentration of 
people aged 65 years and older (in 2021) (26). South Africa (6.0%), 
followed by India (6.8%), Indonesia (6.8%) and Malaysia (7.3%), has 
the lowest proportion of older people in their population. China and 
Singapore have among the fastest ageing populations: between 
2021 and 2040 the fraction of their population aged 65 years and 
older is projected to grow from 13.1 to 26.2%, and from 14.1 to 
29.8%, respectively (18). Unlike health expenditure, information on 
LTC expenditure is not routinely reported or available for many of 
the included countries; information on public LTC spending was 
therefore compiled from a variety of sources. Overall, public LTC 
spending is very low in MICs (multiple sources; see Table 2.1). For 
example, in Costa Rica and Thailand, public spending amounts to 
0.05% and 0.01% of GDP, respectively, compared with 1.1% in 
Australia and 3% in Netherlands (Kingdom of the) (10,25,27). 

2.3  Classification of public LTC financing systems: 
an overview

According to Colombo et al. (3), LTC financing systems can be 
classified within three broad groups. The first group comprises 
systems where LTC coverage is universal and provided within a 
single programme. The most common financing modes within this 
group are the tax-based model adopted in countries such as Norway 
and Sweden, and the social insurance model used in countries such 
as Germany and the Republic of Korea. The second group included a 
diverse range of systems where coverage is achieved through 
multiple universal schemes (e.g. Scotland) or where LTC benefits are 
universal, but the amount is contingent on recipients’ incomes (e.g. 
Australia), or a combination of universal and means-tested 
programmes (e.g. Switzerland). The third group includes countries 
that use means-tested safety-net programmes as the primary means 
of funding LTC. The United States Medicaid programme, which funds 
long-term health, health-related and social services, as well as 
support for low-income Americans (28), and the social care system in 
England, where access to financial support for home, nursing and 
residential care for adults requires both a needs test and a means 
test (29), are two examples of these programmes in a high-income 
setting. The definitions of universality (“all those needing LTC 
because of their dependency status would receive it, including 
higher-income groups, although individuals may still be required to 
pay for a share of the cost”) and means testing (“assessment of the 
financial means (income and assets) of a person to determine 
whether the person is eligible for LTC benefits”) used by Colombo et 
al. (3) are adopted.

Fig. 2.1 summarizes how LTC is financed in the 13 surveyed 
countries. In the four countries included in the left-hand third (India, 
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Indonesia, Malaysia and South Africa), the public sector plays a small 
role in financing LTC; the limited public LTC programmes that are 
present exist predominately in the form of means-tested social 
welfare, providing both cash allowances and services targeting the 
older and disabled segments of their population (e.g. Indonesia and 
Malaysia). In India, there is no formal public delivery system for LTC 
(27), and only a very small number of public LTC facilities exist. The 
majority of LTC facilities are funded and operated by private and 
not-for-profit organizations (30). Although these are means-tested 
safety-net programmes, it is emphasized that they operate mainly 
within the social welfare system as opposed to being within a 
distinct LTC system.

Fig. 2.1. Categorization of public LTC financing systems. Data source: 
Global health expenditure database (17).
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programmes (with some mean-tested 

programmes)

Malaysia: 
Means-tested 
cash, in-kind 

benefits
(PHE: 2.2%)

South Africa: 
Means-tested 
old age grant 
and subsidies
(PHE: 5.3%)

Serbia: 
Universal cash 

benefit, 
income-tested 

subsidies 
(PHE: 5.3%)

Costa Rica: 
Universal 

in-kind, cash; 
means-tested 

programmes for 
poor and 

vulnerable 
(PHE: 5.6%)

Australia: 
Universal, 
multiple 

programmes, tax 
financed

(PHE: 8.0%)

Japan:
Universal, social 

LTC insurance
(PHE: 9.2)

India: 
Limited 

means-tested 
social welfare, 

public facilities
(PHE: 1.1%)

Indonesia: 
Means-tested 
cash, in-kind 

benefits
(PHE: 1.9%)

Thailand: 
Universal 

community-
based 

programmes. 
Means-tested 

social assistance.
(PHE: 3.1%)

China: 
Universal LTCI 

pilots and 
means-tested 
programmes 
(PHE: 3.1%)

Uruguay: 
Universal, tax 

financed 
(PHE: 6.6%)

Netherlands 
(Kingdom of the): 
Universal, social 

LTC insurance 
(PHE: 7.7%)

Singapore: 
Universal social 

LTC insurance 
and government 

subsidies
(PHE: 3.2%)

LTC: long-term care; PHE: public expenditure on health.
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China, Costa Rica, Serbia and Thailand are depicted in the centre of 
Fig. 2.1. These countries use a mixture of limited or small-scale 
universal public LTC programmes that are combined with means-
tested programmes. For example, China has been piloting LTCI in 15 
cities since 2016 (recently expanded to 49 cities in 2020). An LTC 
programme was introduced in Costa Rica in 2021. Serbia has a publicly 
funded universal cash benefit scheme for all eligible disabled people, 
and a means-tested programme providing residential and home care 
targeted at older people. Thailand’s community-based LTC programme, 
partly funded through the Universal Coverage Scheme (the country’s 
universal health care programme), provides community- and home-
based care. Each of these four countries lie within the taxonomy 
outlined by Colombo et al. (3) in different ways. China’s LTCI pilots, 
although small in scale by their nature, have the features of universal 
arrangements similar to those in HICs such as Germany, Japan and 
Netherlands (Kingdom of the) in that they provide access to a wide 
spectrum of LTC services. By contrast, in Serbia and Thailand, universal 
entitlement is limited to a specific benefit or service, namely cash 
benefits (Serbia) or community- and home-based programmes 
(Thailand). China adopts a social-insurance model (similar to Germany, 
Japan and Netherlands (Kingdom of the) to finance its LTC programme; 
Costa Rica’s newly established universal programme, and the 
programmes in Serbia and Thailand, are financed through tax revenues. 

The five reviewed HICs, with more established universal LTC 
programmes, feature in the right-hand third of Fig. 2.1. Australia’s LTC 
system consists of three separate programmes (the Commonwealth 
home support, home care packages and residential care), in which 
users are required to pay a fee comprising a base rate and additional 
component depending on individual income. Japan’s LTC programme 
provides a comprehensive package of services ranging from 
institutional care to community- and home-based care primarily for 
older people. The LTC system in Netherlands (Kingdom of the), which 
is funded by a social-insurance model as for Japan, is targeted at the 
disabled (young and old) assessed as needing LTC. Singapore has a 
mixed system that combines universal LTCI, providing cash payouts 
to those in need, with income-tested LTC subsidies for residential, 
community and home care. Uruguay’s National Care System, 
financed through general taxes, provides home-based personal 
assistance, teleassistance and care at LTC centres.

Fig. 2.1 also highlights that countries with universal public LTC 
programmes tend to have health systems in which the government 
plays a larger role in financing health care. Public share of health 
spending is lowest in the three countries (India, Indonesia and 
Malaysia) that have only means-tested social welfare programmes, 
and is highest in the four countries that use a combination of limited 
or small-scale universal and means-tested programmes. The HICs 
with established universal LTC systems (Australia, Japan, Netherlands 
(Kingdom of the) and Uruguay) are also the settings in which the 
public sector plays the largest role in financing health care.
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2.4  Public LTC financing classification and country 
summary

In this section, the public LTC systems of the reviewed countries are 
discussed in greater detail. The eight MICs for which published 
research is relatively scant are the focus although, where relevant, 
comparisons are made with the five HICs. To gauge the extent to 
which ageing is a national priority in these countries, the national 
LTC and ageing care plans in these countries are reviewed. It is also 
noted whether plans are in place and, if so, their implementation 
date. A summary of the public LTC coverage in the 13 studied 
countries is provided in Table 2.2. 

2.4.1  Mixed system of universal and means-tested 
programmes

Four MICs (China, Costa Rica, Serbia and Thailand) have adopted a 
mixed system of LTC provision through limited or small-scale 
universal public LTC programmes combined with means-tested 
programmes. The features of universal programmes in these 
countries vary over several key dimensions, both between MICs and 
when compared with HICs. First, the types of benefits covered under 
the universal programmes vary. For example, China subsidizes LTC 
services (personal, community-based, home and residential care) as 
in HICs Australia, Japan and Netherlands (Kingdom of the), whereas 
Serbia provides cash benefits as in Singapore. Costa Rica and 
Thailand cover both services and cash benefits in the form of 
allowances to caregivers and care recipients. 

There are often limits on benefits through explicit caps on the 
services or subsidies. In addition, subsidies vary by the types of 
services or by individuals’ assessment of need. For example, the 
benefits package in Thailand differs by level of frailty. In China, LTCI 
funds typically reimburse a fraction of the cost of services subject to 
a reimbursement cap. To illustrate, in Anqing (one of the pilot cities) 
in the province of Anhui, LTCI pays 50% of the cost of nursing homes 
with a payment ceiling of 5.8 United States dollars (US$; 1 US$ = 
6.90 Chinese yuan as of 1 January 2023 according to https://www.
exchangerates.org.uk/) per person per day, which equates to 3% of 
local average income.

Despite all adopting a mixed system, these four countries vary in 
how their universal programmes and means-tested programmes 
coexist. Serbia has a system of universal cash benefits for all 
disabled individuals (young and old), combined with a means-tested 
programme (income-based) to provide services. The means-tested 
programmes in China, Costa Rica and Thailand are focused on 
providing assistance in the form of services for low-income and 
vulnerable members of the population (e.g. those without family 
support). Public LTC programmes in China, Costa Rica, Serbia and 
Thailand are briefly described in the following. 
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(a) China

China’s LTC system mirrors its health system and social security 
system; it is a multi-tier system, in which the lower tier is an 
assistance programme for the poor, the middle tier is a basic 
universal programme and the upper tier is private. In 2016, China 
implemented a series of LTCI pilot programmes in 15 cities and 
expanded the programme to cover 49 cities in 2020. In 2019, 
88.5 million individuals were covered by the LTCI pilots and 426 000 
people had received benefits (31). The public LTCI programme 
provides basic LTC services, with a focus on care for people aged 
60 years and older and the disabled. Insured people are eligible to 
access benefits if they are deemed to be severely disabled for 
6 months or longer (32). The LTCI, financed through a social health 
insurance model, covers individuals that are enrolled in the basic 
medical insurance programmes, Urban Employee Basic Medical 
Insurance (UEBMI) and Urban Resident Basic Medical Insurance 
(URBMI). The exact financing mechanisms differ between pilot cities, 
and generally comprise contributions from the pooled funds of the 
basic medical insurance programme, direct contributions from 
individuals and/or through their medical savings accounts, and 
government subsidies. In some cities, the local government 
contributes to the LTCI funding pool only if basic medical insurance 
pooled funds are in deficit. 

Services covered under LTCI include basic care, medical care (not 
already covered by health insurance), nursing care, home care and 
residential (or nursing home) care. LTCI reimburses 50–90% of the 
cost, subject to a benefit cap or payment ceiling, with beneficiaries 
responsible for the remainder. The caps on benefits vary between 
cities, but they are usually very low. For example, in Chengde city, 
the payment ceiling for residential care is US$ 8.7 per person per 
day, which equates to 4% of local average income (33). Old-age 
allowances have been paid to people aged 80 years and older from 
2016, with the allowance amount and eligibility rules varying 
between cities.

Means-tested programmes complement the universal coverage 
offered through LTCI. Low-income individuals requiring LTC can 
access home-based care that provides services including assistance 
with activities of daily living (ADLs), bathing, rehabilitation, meals 
and transportation. This programme is financed by the Public 
Welfare Lottery Fund, which is funded by the central government; 
programme eligibility rules are not explicit. Community-based 
programmes, such as community centres in urban areas and old-age 
(“happiness”) homes in rural areas, provide services such as 
assistance with ADLs, meals and health education. The government 
also provides indirect support to the private sector through the 
provision of land, tax cuts and subsidies for building private LTC 
residential facilities.
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(b) Costa Rica

Costa Rica is the second Latin American country to establish a 
national LTC system, through a presidential decree on the 
implementation of the National Care Policy (2021–2031) that began 
in 2021. Under the National Care Policy, the country will provide 
universal benefits in services and cash allowance to eligible disabled 
adults based on their need for help with performing ADLs. 
Caregivers can also be beneficiaries. The universal LTC programme is 
financed through general tax revenues combined with user co-
payments (but the level of co-payment is yet to be determined) (34). 
When implemented at scale, the programme is expected to cost 
US$ 253 million per year (0.48% of GDP). Three broad categories of 
services are covered under the programme: care services (home, 
residential, tele- or remote, and day care), cash for care (for home-
based caregivers) and training for caregivers. The types of care 
services are to be defined and developed over the course of the 
programme’s implementation.

Two means-tested programmes already exist alongside the planned 
universal LTC programme. The Consejo National de la Persona Adulta 
Mayor targets individuals aged 60 years and older and in poverty, 
and provides subsidies for care providers covering institutional 
(residential) care, home care and day care. The Consejo National de 
las Personas con Discapacidad covers disabled individuals younger 
than 65 years and in poverty via subsidies for institutional care. Both 
programmes are funded by the Social Development and Family 
Allowance Fund, financed through general payroll taxes and taxes on 
items such as alcohol and tobacco (referred to throughout as “sin 
taxes”).

(c) Serbia

Serbia has a universal programme providing cash benefits to 
individuals with physical or mental impairments that affect their 
capacity to perform ADLs, and those with severe sight or hearing 
impairment. There are two levels of benefits: basic and increased, 
with the latter covering individuals with higher levels of disability 
(which applies to ≥ 70% of benefit claimants). In 2016, the monthly 
basic and increased benefits amounted to US$ 157–261 
(approximately 20% of average wage) and US$ 265 (58% of average 
wage), respectively (22). The cash benefit programme is delivered by 
the Ministry of Labour, Employment, Veteran and Social Policy, which 
is funded through general taxation.

In addition to the universal cash benefit programme, two means-
tested programmes provide benefits in the form of services for 
individuals in need. The first programme covers institutional LTC in 
public residential homes targeting people aged 65 years and older. 
This programme is delivered and financed by the Ministry of Labour, 
Employment, Veteran and Social Policy, with user contributions in 
the form of co-payment. Beneficiaries with low or no income are 
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exempt from payment. In 2016, 24% of residents received some 
subsidies, 21% received a full subsidy and the remaining 55% paid 
for their care in full (22). The second programme provides day care 
and home care services to a very small number of low-income 
individuals. Services covered include home care (support with 
personal hygiene, feeding and cleaning) and day care in community 
settings. The programme is also delivered by the ministry with 
additional funding from local governments and contributions from 
users and donors.

(d) Thailand

Thailand has a universal community-based LTC programme that 
provides community- and home-based care for frail individuals aged 
60 years and older. The programme is partly funded through the 
country’s tax-financed universal health care programme (Universal 
Coverage Scheme). The generosity of the benefits package depends 
on the level of frailty. Services include the provision of in-home 
visits by home caregivers, care management (e.g. care assessment 
and development of care plan), social care such as support for ADLs, 
improvement to home environment, assistive devices and medical 
care services. Complementing the community LTC programme are 
two universal allowance programmes targeting the older and 
disabled populations. All people aged 60 years and older are eligible 
for the allowance of US$ 20–33 per month (35), and disabled 
individuals with disability identification are eligible for an additional 
allowance of US$ 26 per month (35). A separate means-tested 
assistance programme for vulnerable older people provides financial 
assistance, secure accommodation and food. Thailand also runs a 
volunteer programme (the Village Health Volunteers), in which 
volunteers play an advocacy role connecting older people with 
health care personnel, organize community activities and undertake 
home visits. 

2.4.2 Means-tested programmes

Public LTC financing programmes in India, Indonesia, Malaysia and 
South Africa exist predominantly through multiple means-tested 
programmes. Malaysia offers services and cash allowances for their 
older populations, whereas Indonesia primarily offers services. 
Assistance in both countries is targeted at low-income individuals 
and those who lack financial and caregiving support from family. 
Overall, family-based caregiving is still emphasized. LTC also remains 
largely the responsibility of the family in India; although public LTC 
facilities are available, they exist in very small numbers. Below, the 
LTC programmes in India, Indonesia, Malaysia and South Africa are 
briefly described. 

(a) India

India’s most recent national policy on ageing (the National Policy for 
Senior Citizens) was announced in 2011. The policy seeks to 
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prioritize the needs of the population aged 80 years and older while 
promoting ageing in place. The focus of the policy is on building 
formal and informal support systems for the older population 
through a mixture of public health services, health insurance and 
health services provided by civil society and the private sector (27). 
Despite this policy, LTC still remains largely the responsibility of the 
family (36). There is no formal or organized public service delivery 
system for LTC, although some programmes include components of 
LTC (27,30). Only a very small number of public LTC residential 
facilities exist. The majority of LTC residential facilities are funded 
and operated by private and not-for-profit organizations (30). 

(b) Indonesia

Indonesia announced a new National Strategy on Ageing in 2021 
with the target of implementing a national policy and funding 
strategy for LTC by 2024. This proposed national policy will involve a 
significant expansion of the LTC delivery system capacity, and the 
improved integration of LTC for older people into the country’s 
public health care system at village-level health clinics (Puskesmas) 
through the Posyandu Lansia and Puskesmas Santun Lansia activities 
(37). Currently, Indonesia’s public LTC financing programme 
comprises multiple means-tested programmes supporting LTC 
services largely implemented by community-based organizations. 
Care programmes are prioritized for eligible older individuals based 
on status of neglect (in poverty with limited access to facilities or 
family support). The largest programme with public support is 
Elderly Family Care (Bina Keluarga Lanjutusia), operating with the 
support of the Family Planning Board within the Ministry of Health. 
Elderly Family Care comprises an estimated 31 000 nongovernment 
and volunteer groups, providing direct services as well as training to 
family caregivers and other informal workers, helping more than 
625 000 older people annually across the country (38). Slightly 
smaller in scale, social welfare groups for older people (Lembaga 
Kesejahteraan Sosial Lansia) are voluntary social organizations 
formed under the guidance of the Ministry of Social Affairs to 
support social rehabilitation and social functioning; the groups 
provide services such as meals and delivery of some supplies, while 
family members continue to provide direct daily care at home to 
their older members. Both programmes receive some grant support 
from their respective ministries. 

An additional social assistance programme offers monthly cash 
allowances for older people (rebranded as Bantu Lu in 2019) that can 
be used for basic needs (39). The current strategy for expanding LTC 
care by 2024 will rely on increased public support for Elderly Family 
Care (which in turn promotes family caregiving) as well as expanded 
direct provision of LTC and primary care services for older people 
coordinated at public Puskesmas health clinics (37). System-wide 
reforms to pensions or non-contributory assistance to older people 
are being considered (40).
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(c) Malaysia

Through the National Health Policy for Older Persons announced in 
2011, the government has made a commitment to ensure older 
people achieve optimal health through integrated and 
comprehensive health and health-related services. Malaysia’s public 
LTC programme comprises a series of means-tested programmes 
providing cash benefits and LTC services for those aged 60 years 
and older, in poverty and unable to support themselves. Publicly 
funded services include government-funded residential homes 
(Rumah Ehsan and Ruman Seri Kenangan), community-based activity 
centres and transport services. Additionally, the Bantuan Warga Emas 
programme provides a cash living allowance to eligible people (aged 
60 years and older, without financial means or family). A home-help 
service programme, Khidmat Bantu di Rumah, is supported by welfare 
volunteers and provides home assistance with ADLs for older people 
dependent on care.

(d) South Africa

South Africa has well developed policy frameworks around ageing 
and the rights of older people, having introduced the South African 
Policy for Older Persons in 2005, and both the South African Plan of 
Action on Ageing and South African Older Persons Act in 2006. Since 
the introduction of these policies, there has been little progress in 
the development of large-scale public programmes focusing on 
older people and on LTC because of a lack of funding and weak 
implementation (41). The Department of Social Development 
manages residential-, community- and home-based care 
programmes. Public residential care is targeted at people aged 
60 years and older who are frail and destitute. A total of 417 
residential facilities are registered under this programme (42), the 
majority of which are run by nongovernmental or religious 
organizations. Home-based care comprises assistance with 
household chores and personal care; day care is also provided for 
older people to assist working families. An old-age grant/pension is 
administered by the South African Social Security Agency; under this 
programme, beneficiaries aged 60 or 75 years and older receive a 
cash allowance of US$ 117 or 118 (1 US$ = 17 South African rand in 
2022), respectively (43). 
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Table 2.2. Summary of public LTC coverage in reviewed high- and middle-income countries

Country LTC system 
classification

Coverage 
programmes

Name of 
programme(s) 

Source of LTC financing Target population Types of benefits 
provided 

Australia Universal Multiple 
programmes: 
income-related 
benefits

Commonwealth home 
support, home care 
packages, residential 
care

Tax-based subsidy and 
user fees

All Home support, 
nursing and 
residential care 
(personal, clinical, 
social)

China Mixed 
system: 
universal 
pilots and 
means tested

Public LTC social 
insurance 
model 

(i) LTC insurance 
pilots;  
(ii) subsidies to 
private service 
providers

(i) Social health 
insurance funds, local 
government subsidies; 
for some cities, 
employer contributions 
and individual 
contributions from 
medical savings 
accounts; 
(ii) tax subsidy, in kind 
(e.g. provision of land)

(i) All (pilots in 49 
cities since 2020); 
severely disabled 
for ≥ 6 months; 
(ii) NR

(i) Basic, medical and 
nursing care; caps on 
benefits with very 
low payment ceiling; 
(ii) government 
purchase of services, 
provision of land, tax 
breaks, subsidies

Means tested Social welfare for the 
vulnerable (e.g. those 
without family 
support)

Tax (central government 
program); Public Welfare 
Lottery Fund

Low-income or 
qualified for public 
social welfare

Home-based, 
residential, transport 
and medical care

Costa Rica Mixed 
system: 
universal and 
means tested

Universal, tax 
based

National Care Policy 
(2021–2031) 

Tax, user co-payment (to 
be defined)

Adults with 
disability 

Home care, 
residential care, tele 
(remote) care, day 
care services; training 
for caregiver; cash 
benefit
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Country LTC system 
classification

Coverage 
programmes

Name of 
programme(s) 

Source of LTC financing Target population Types of benefits 
provided 

Means tested 
for subsidies 
(subsidies to 
care provider)

Consejo National de 
la Persona Adulta 
Mayor; Consejo 
National de las 
Personas con 
Discapacidad

Social Development and 
Family Allowance Fund 
(general payroll taxes, 
sin taxes)

Aged ≥ 60 years, in 
poverty; aged < 65 
years with disability 
and in poverty

Subsidies to care 
providers; 
institutional, home 
and day care (not 
implemented in 2019)

India Means tested Means-tested 
social care/
welfare (limited)

NR NR NR Few public residential 
homes, day care 
centres, domiciliary 
care services 
(predominantly 
private, not-for-profit)

Indonesia Means tested; 
government 
provides 
services; 
public 
funding to 
NGOs

Means-tested 
social care/
welfare

(i) Puskesmas primary 
care for older people; 
(ii) Puskesmas LTC for 
older people;  
(iii) Posyandu Lansia 
health posts for older 
people;  
(iv) Elderly Family 
Care (Bina Keluarga 
Lanjutusia) groups to 
support home-based 
LTC;  
(v) other cash 
benefits, social 
support programmes 
via social 
organizations 
(Lembaga 
Kesejahteraan Sosial)

(i)–(v) Tax revenue 
(Ministry of Health, 
Ministry of Social Affairs, 
National Insurance 
Agency)

(i)–(iv) Older people 
(not explicitly 
defined); 
(v) level of poverty 
or neglect

(i) Screening, 
noncommunicable 
disease management, 
rehabilitation;  
(ii) LTC/nursing at 
home;  
(iii) screening;  
(iv) training for home 
care (both ADLs and 
IADLs);  
(v) cash, meals, 
material support
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Country LTC system 
classification

Coverage 
programmes

Name of 
programme(s) 

Source of LTC financing Target population Types of benefits 
provided 

Japan Universal Public LTC social 
insurance 
model 

LTC insurance system Taxes (from national 
government, prefecture 
and municipality); 
premiums from those 
aged ≥ 40 years; user 
fees (10%)

Primary insured (≥ 
65 years); 
secondary insured 
(40–64 years)

Institutional care, 
domiciliary home 
help, nursing and 
bathing services; day 
care and respite care 
for people living at 
home; home 
equipment and 
adaptations; 
residential care (e.g. 
for people with 
dementia)

Malaysia Means tested; 
government 
provides 
services; 
public 
funding to 
NGOs

Means-tested 
social care/
welfare

(i) Activity centres 
(Pusat Aktiviti Warga 
Emas);  
(ii) government-run 
residential homes 
(Rumah Ehsan; Rumah 
Seri Kenangan);  
(iii) cash living 
allowances for older 
people (Bantuan 
Warga Emas);  
(iv) public support for 
private home help 
services (Khidmat 
Bantu di Rumah)

Tax revenue from central 
government via 
Department of Social 
Welfare, under Ministry 
of Women, Family and 
Community 
Development; private 
NGOs

Age ≥ 60 years; ill, 
homeless, poor or 
disabled

(i) Community 
workers help with 
ADLs and social 
activities;  
(ii) full nursing care; 
(iii) cash living 
allowance;  
(iv) home visits for 
IADL support
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Country LTC system 
classification

Coverage 
programmes

Name of 
programme(s) 

Source of LTC financing Target population Types of benefits 
provided 

Netherlands 
(Kingdom of 
the)

Multiple 
universal 
schemes

Public LTC social 
insurance 
model 

(i) Long-term Care Act 
(residential care or 
intensive home care); 
(ii) Social Support Act 
(non-medical 
support);  
(iii) Health Insurance 
Act (medical care or 
nursing care)

(i) Payroll premiums and 
user fees;  
(ii) taxes from 
municipality and user 
fees;  
(iii) health insurance 
premiums (no user fees 
for district nursing)

All people assessed 
as needing care, 
regardless of age 

Residential, home 
care, social and 
medical services 

Serbia Mixed 
system: 
universal and 
means tested

Universal, tax 
based 

Cash benefit (for 
disabled people)

Tax revenue (from 
Ministry of Labor, 
Employment, Veterans 
and Social Policy)

All disabled Cash benefit (basic; 
enhanced with higher 
impairment)

Income-related 
benefits

Institutional care in 
public homes for 
older people; day 
care and home care 
services

(i) Tax revenue (from 
Ministry of Labor, 
Employment, Veterans 
and Social Policy);  
(ii) tax revenue (local 
government, national 
budget), donors, user 
co-payment

(i) Mainly those 
aged ≥ 65 years;  
(ii) all (in practice, 
older people or 
those in need)

(i) Institutional care; 
(ii) home and day care 

Singapore Mixed 
system: 
universal and 
means tested

Public LTC social 
insurance 
model 

CareShield Life, Elder 
Shield 

Premiums: private 
contributions (personal 
and family medical 
savings accounts or 
cash), tax revenue 
(means-tested subsidy 
on premiums)

Aged ≥ 30 years Cash benefits

Income-related 
benefits

Intermediate and LTC 
subsidies

Tax revenue, user co-
payment

All Home, community 
and residential care 
services
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Country LTC system 
classification

Coverage 
programmes

Name of 
programme(s) 

Source of LTC financing Target population Types of benefits 
provided 

South Africa Means tested Income-related 
benefit

(i) Old-age grant/
pension;  
(ii) grant-in-aid;  
(iii) disability grant 

Tax revenue (general 
revenue)

(i) Aged ≥ 60 years; 
(ii) old-age grant 
recipients with 
degree of frailty; 
(iii) aged 19–59 
years with disability 

Cash benefit 

Means tested 
for subsidies 
(subsidies to 
care provider)

(i) Residential care;  
(ii) community-based 
care services

Tax revenue (general 
revenue)

(i) Aged ≥ 60 years; 
(ii) older people 
residing in the 
community

(i) Institutional care; 
(ii) home and day care

Thailand Mixed 
system: 
universal and 
means tested

Universal tax 
based 

Community-based 
LTC programme

Universal coverage 
scheme, public fund 
(Elder Fund, Treasury 
Department), user  
co-payment

Aged ≥ 60 years; 
with degree of 
frailty

Community- and 
home-based care 
(home visits, care 
management, social 
care, health care)

Allowances Disability allowance; 
old-age allowance

Ministry of Social 
Development and 
Human Security 
(National Office of 
Promotion and 
Development of Life 
Quality of Disabled 
Persons)

All with disability Cash benefit

Means-tested 
assistance

Various (i) Elderly fund (through 
sin taxes);  
(ii) Ministry of Social 
Development and 
Human Security

(i) Aged ≥ 60 years; 
(ii) the vulnerable  

(i) In kind 
(accommodation, 
food, funeral);  
(ii) cash benefit
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Country LTC system 
classification

Coverage 
programmes

Name of 
programme(s) 

Source of LTC financing Target population Types of benefits 
provided 

Uruguay Universal Universal tax 
based

(i) National Care 
System;  
(ii) Cupo Cama (Bed 
Quota)

(i) General taxation from 
central government, 
income-tested co-
payment;  
(ii) social security fund, 
co-payment

(i) Age ≥ 60 years, 
all ages with 
disability, children 
aged < 12 years;  
(ii) low-income 
pensioners with 
severe dependency

(i) Allowance for 
home care (personal 
assistance), 
teleassistance (alarm 
service), day and 
night centres, training 
for caregivers;  
(ii) monetary 
subsidies for 
residency in care 
home

ADL: activity of daily living; GDP: gross domestic product; IADL: instrumental activity of daily living; LTC: long-term care; NGO: nongovernmental 
organization; NR: not reported.
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Many of the countries reviewed have programmes in which the 
government either directly provides, or finances, LTC services for 
older individuals. This chapter describes these services, as well as 
the most common forms of public funding for those services. 
Publicly funded LTC services can be classified as the provision of 
either: residential care in both public and private residential 
institutions; or care in home and community settings, which may be 
administered directly by government agencies and organizations, or 
by external organizations (e.g. private, non-profit) that receive public 
support through grants or subsidies.

3.1  Residential care homes

3.1.1  Availability

Several of the countries reviewed have public residential LTC 
institutions that provide round-the-clock care to a small fraction of 
the country’s population (Table 3.1) (41,42,44–47). Public residential 
homes, which often form part of the public social safety-net 
programme, cater to older people of high dependency and who have 
limited financial resources, either personally or within their 
supporting family. 

In Malaysia, residential homes are managed by two public 
programmes – the Rumah Seri Kenangan and Rumah Ehsan – that are 
operated by the Department of Social Welfare and the Ministry of 
Women, Family and Community Development. There are 18 state 
and federal government-owned residential homes that serve 2400 
older people without family support. By contrast, a significantly 
larger proportion of care-dependent older people in Malaysia are 
served by over 1000 private care homes that operate without public 
funding (48,49). Similarly, Serbia provides public assistance to 
around 6780 older people through 43 state-run residential homes. 
The programme, managed by the Ministry of Labour, Employment, 
Veteran and Social Policy, has a considerable waiting list, 
highlighting the unmet demand for such facilities. In South Africa, 
there are only nine public institutions that are operated by local or 
national governments, while the private sector has hundreds of such 
institutions.

In other countries, the government provides subsidies to private 
residential institutions to subsidize the cost of residential LTC. For 
example, Uruguay’s Cupo Cama (Bed Quota) programme, which is 
designed as one of three housing solution policies for vulnerable 
older people, subsidizes rents at registered old-age homes. These 
subsidy models enable public financing to increase coverage for LTC 
among fully institutionalized older people by taking advantage of 
the capacity offered by private providers. In South Africa, any 
registered residential facility, whether public or private, is eligible to 
apply for public support on a per capita basis. 
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Table 3.1. Public residential care home programmes

Country, 
programme

Financing Eligibility Benefits (in-kind 
services)

Service providers and 
provider payment

Governance arrangements

Malaysia, 
public 
residential 
homes

General tax revenue, at 
national or state level, 
depending on 
ownership; no user 
contributions

Restricted to older 
people without 
income or family 
support; voluntary 
application or 
referral; low- and 
high-dependency 
models of care

Residential, 
nursing care, 
food, support for 
ADLs

Public residential 
institutions (Rumah Seri 
Kenangan and Rumah 
Ehsan); 18 public 
institutions, owned by state 
and federal governments; 
public subsidies through 
supply-side operating 
budget

Department of Social 
Welfare under Ministry of 
Women, Family and 
Community Development 

Serbia, public 
residential 
homes

General tax revenue 
with user contributions; 
government funding 
covers operational 
costs, including wages 
of the staff and 
maintenance of 
buildings; users are 
charged an 
accommodation fee 
which varies by location, 
occupancy and level of 
services needed 
(subsidies available)  

No specific 
assessment for 
placement in public 
institution; 87% of 
residents aged ≥ 65 
years (44)

Residential, 
nursing care, 
food, support for 
ADLs

43 public residential 
institutions with uneven 
geographic distribution; 
public subsidies through 
per-capita subsidy for 
low-income older 
individuals

Local centres for social 
work assess financial ability 
to pay and determine the 
cost-sharing; Ministry of 
Labour, Employment, 
Veteran and Social Policy 
provides the subsidy for 
those who cannot pay full 
cost
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Country, 
programme

Financing Eligibility Benefits (in-kind 
services)

Service providers and 
provider payment

Governance arrangements

South Africa, 
residential 
care homes

All registered facilities 
(public or private) can 
apply for a subsidy (US$ 
5.88 per resident per 
month); estimated total 
public spending on 
subsidies in 2014 was 
US$ 2.94 million (42); 
additional public 
support may be directed 
to some institutional 
homes via NGO grants, 
but no data available

Restricted to people 
aged ≥ 60 years 
who are frail, 
destitute and 
needing full-time 
care; care 
dependency and 
financial need are 
evaluated by 
Department of 
Social Development 
through a screening 
test and home visit

Residential, 
nursing care, 
food, support for 
ADLs

Both public and private 
residential homes; of 417 
formally registered 
residential facilities, nine 
operated by local or 
national government and 
remainder operated by 
NGOs including religious 
charities, and 
disproportionately 
available in wealthier 
regions of the country 
(41,42,45); public subsidies 
through per capita subsidy 
for low-income older 
individuals

Department of Social 
Development registers 
facilities, although it has 
been criticized for assessing 
only a handful of them (as 
of 2012)

Uruguay, Cupo 
Cama (Bed 
Quota) 

Social Security Fund, 
financed by payroll 
taxes and user co-
payment; subsidies 
(30–70% of cost) 
account for 33% of total 
revenue; remaining 65% 
of revenue is out-of-
pocket payments by 
beneficiaries or their 
families (46)

Restricted to older 
people who have a 
pension from the 
Social Security 
Fund, qualify for 
housing assistance, 
and with severe 
dependency or 
emotional/mental 
vulnerability

Payment of rent 
for older people 
at a qualified 
home; one of 
three housing 
solution policies 
for vulnerable 
older people

Private residential homes; 
most long-term 
establishments for the 
elderly registered by 
community organizations 
(65%) or faith-based 
agencies (20%) (47); public 
subsidies through per 
capita subsidy with user 
cost-sharing

Policies around services 
and payments for 
residential care from Social 
Security Fund; quality of 
facilities regulated by 
National Care System, which 
also oversees early 
childhood and other social 
services

ADL: activity of daily living; IADL: instrumental activity of daily living; NGO: nongovernmental organization; US$: United States dollars.
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In China, the government (mostly subnational and local government) 
provides financial incentives for the private-sector development of 
LTC facilities in the form of subsidies for new construction and 
ongoing operating subsidies for occupied beds (50). These subsidies 
are used in conjunction with tax exemptions, land allotment or 
leasing for new construction, and reduced utility rates, and are 
aimed at encouraging private-sector investment in the development 
of LTC services. 

3.1.2  Eligibility 

Due to the limited availability of spaces in residential homes, 
eligibility for public support is restricted in all the reviewed 
countries. Malaysia restricts public residential homes to older 
people lacking income or family support. Individuals can apply 
voluntarily or through a referral process; those who are independent 
can be accommodated in Rumah Seri Kenangan and those who are 
care-dependent and/or have an infectious disease are placed in 
Rumah Ehsan. Less than 2000 older people are estimated to benefit 
from these programmes every year (51). 

In Serbia, in which approximately 87% of those residing in these 
facilities are aged 65 years and older, there is no specific assessment 
for placement in public homes. Although there has been a recent 
increase in capacity, the increasing waiting list highlights the 
unfulfilled demand. In 2018, publicly funded residents represented 
approximately 9000 of a total of 23 415 residents in private or 
public institutions (1.4% of the older population), an increase of 
60% since 2015 (44). 

South Africa restricts eligibility for public subsidy and admission to a 
public institution to those aged 60 years and older, and who are frail, 
destitute and require full-time care. The South African Department 
of Social Development evaluates care dependency and financial 
need through a screening test and home visit. However, racial 
imbalances in the utilization of residential facilities persist, with 
Black South Africans comprising less than 4% of all residents in 
institutions; strong racial disparities in care dependency and 
demographic ageing highlight the greater need for this population 
group (42). An estimated 42 000 residents receive public subsidies, 
but information on distribution by race and facility ownership is not 
available. Private facilities manage their own admissions processes, 
which have been criticized for perpetuating these imbalances (42). 

3.1.3 Benefits

Residential homes offer a range of services that include nursing care 
such as medication administration, specialized dementia care, 
occupational and physical therapy, and assistance with ADLs. The 
specific services provided may vary depending on regulation, 
workforce availability and preferences of residents. In Serbia and 
Malaysia, some public residential homes offer only social care and 
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support for ADLs, while others provide nursing care. Serbia’s care 
homes provide rooms, meals and housekeeping, similar to Malaysia’s 
Rumah Seri Kenangan, which offer a safe living environment, 
religious guidance, counselling, physiotherapy, recreational activities 
and some medical treatment.

A smaller number of public residential homes offer nursing care. 
Malaysia’s Rumah Ehsan provides the same services as Rumah Seri 
Kenangan but can also provide medical treatment for infectious 
diseases (Box 3.1). 

Box 3.1. Malaysia’s long legacy of public homes 

Before independence, Malaysia had a long history of charitable, 
private “old folks’ homes” that mostly supported unmarried male 
laborers from India and China who did not have a next of kin. By the 
1960s, the Malaysian government took over several of these homes 
and positioned the public institutionalization of a small subset of 
elders who lacked family support as a component of its social 
welfare strategy. Today’s public institutions that represent this 
legacy – Rumah Ehsan and Rumah Seri Kenangan – serve at most 
2400 older people, which is a fraction of the country’s total older 
population. Over 1000 private care homes operated by 
nongovernmental, religious and private/commercial entities, of 
which perhaps one third are registered and licensed, now serve a 
much greater share of the care-dependent older population.

3.1.4	Financing mechanisms and cost-sharing

Most of the residential programmes are funded through general 
taxation, and cost-sharing arrangements vary. In Malaysia, public 
residential homes are funded by national or state government, 
depending on ownership. The Malaysian national or state 
governments bear the full costs of operating public residential 
homes, and there are no charges levied on residents. 

This is different from Serbia, where cost-sharing is used to reduce 
the financial commitment of the government (Box 3.2). Government 
funding covers operational costs, including wages of the staff and 
maintenance of residential buildings. Users are charged an 
accommodation fee that varies by location, occupancy of the 
accommodation and level of services needed. Beneficiaries with low 
or no income receive some subsidies, while those with moderate to 
severe functional restrictions are fully subsidized. 
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Box 3.2. Cost-sharing in Serbia’s residential homes 

Serbia’s residential homes cost approximately US$ 247–553 (US$ 1 
= 0.93 euros as of 1 January 2023) per person per month (44). 
Approximately 65% of the total cost is borne by the national 
government, including paying providers and maintaining buildings. 
An older person or their family is expected to pay the remaining 
35% (the accommodation cost, which varies significantly by 
location and level of services provided), unless the local centre for 
social work determines the older person is eligible for a subsidy. In 
2016, 55% of residents in public institutions paid the full user fee, 
24% received co-financing and 21% were fully subsidized by the 
budget of the institution. This public funding model in Serbia 
depends on national and local sources, and the level of resources 
provided by local governments varies between regions.

Uruguay’s Cupo Cama programme is subsidized through the Social 
Security Fund and user co-payment. The subsidy accounts for around 
one third of the total revenue of residential centres, with the 
remaining two thirds of the revenue from (out-of-pocket) payments 
by residents or their families (52).

3.2	 Home- and community-based LTC care 
programmes

A number of reviewed countries have public programmes that offer 
support for LTC services in home or community settings (Table 3.2) 
(37,39,44,46,53–58). These programmes come in different forms, 
including supply-side financing (supply-side subsidies) through 
public payments in the form of operational grants to LTC-providing 
organizations who may engage formal or informal LTC caregivers, or 
demand-directed funding through public payments that follow an 
individual’s choice of provider. 

3.2.1	Governance arrangements and service providers 

Government-funded home-visit programmes are common in many of 
the reviewed countries, although the nature of caregiving (and 
caregivers) varies depending on the priorities and ideologies of the 
country. For example, Uruguay emphasizes formal caregiving, where 
an older person selects a registered care assistant from a list and 
their wages are paid directly by the national Social Security Fund. 
Care assistants must meet certain qualifications, including training 
and registration, and be without a close relationship (e.g. familial) to 
the beneficiary. By contrast, Thailand relies on community-based 
health services and prioritizes caregiving by family members. Their 
programme trains volunteer caregivers from the community, who 
may be paid or unpaid, and their primary role is to strengthen the 
capabilities of family members to provide care. Each caregiver is 
responsible for a group (7–15) of older people and is supervised by 
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care managers who have received special training. Care managers 
are often nurses, physiotherapists or social workers (12,42).

Publicly funded home-visit programmes in Indonesia, Malaysia and 
Serbia do not directly engage individual caregivers but instead fund 
private and community organizations who identify and mobilize 
informal volunteer workers to provide home-based care. In Indonesia 
for example, the Elderly Family Care group (Bina Keluarga Lanjutusia) 
is not a legal entity but can be formed as an activity associated with 
an existing local health centre or community organization. 
Volunteers are compensated for their time through the use of 
stipends or allowances for transportation costs. In Serbia, provider 
organizations must be licensed in social care. These organizations 
can engage LTC caregivers, who may be paid or unpaid volunteers 
from the community, or para-professionals with some LTC training, 
such as Serbia’s Gerontology Housewives. Of all the publicly funded 
interventions examined, these community-based mechanisms 
provide the broadest coverage; by relying on thousands of LTC 
caregivers, many of whom are from the communities they serve, tens 
or hundreds of thousands of beneficiaries can be reached. 

The home- and community-based LTC programmes vary according to 
the overall rationale for public intervention. These may be from the 
perspective of the health care system, social welfare, social 
protection, or pension and labour, or a combination of these. 
Although the country examples discussed in this report are not 
exhaustive, they show these different perspectives. In the case of 
Thailand’s community-based LTC services and Indonesia’s Posyandu 
Lansia, these programmes fall under the health care system and are 
governed by the same entities that provide health services, such as 
the Ministry of Health and the relative health insurance agencies. In 
contrast, some countries organize home-based care under their 
social care systems. For example, Malaysia’s Home Help Services 
(Khidmat Bantu di Rumah) programme is operated by the Department 
of Social Welfare in collaboration with the Ministry of Health, while 
Serbia’s day care and home care services are provided by the 
Ministry of Labour, Employment, Veteran and Social Policy. Uruguay’s 
Programa de Asistentes Personales is provided by the Ministry of 
Social Development, which also determines the level of care needed 
and makes payments through the Social Security Fund.

3.2.2	Eligibility 

The community- and home-based services that are publicly funded 
and targeted at those aged 60 or 65 years and older are usually only 
available to those with some level of care dependency. Uruguay’s 
Programa de Asistentes Personales is even more tightly rationed, and 
is only available to those aged 80 years and older with high care 
dependency and low household income. The level of dependency is 
determined by the Ministry of Social Development based on a 
questionnaire and home visit using a national standard for 
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evaluation of four aspects of ADLs: level of functional performance, 
types of problems (physical and/or mental), type of help needed and 
frequency of help required. In contrast, LTC programmes within 
Indonesia and Thailand involve caregivers who assess dependency 
needs and coordinate care with the primary health system, and have 
no income-based restrictions. 

LTC programmes have varying target criteria between countries 
according to family structure. For example, Malaysia’s Khidmat Bantu 
di Rumah programme is aimed at older individuals who live alone 
and have no income or family support, whereas Thailand’s 
community LTC programme and Indonesia’s Elderly Family Group 
provide training, support and respite to family members who provide 
the bulk of direct care at home.

Estimating the overall coverage of publicly funded community- and 
home-based care is challenging, particularly in LMICs. In Serbia and 
Uruguay, where governments pay individual caregivers, the total 
coverage is roughly 1.25% of the older population. Although 
community-based interventions have the broadest coverage in 
potentially serving tens or even hundreds of thousands of 
beneficiaries, assessing and maintaining the quality of these 
interventions can be challenging. In Thailand for example, when the 
Home Care Service Volunteers programme was reviewed in 2016, 
concerns were raised about the inconsistent and/or low quality of 
services provided by volunteers. This programme was updated and 
upgraded as the Community-Based Long-Term Care programme with 
para-professional care managers, and extensively piloted to improve 
professional LTC and health support, particularly for older people 
with high dependency.

3.2.3	Services and benefits

The overarching goal of home-based care programmes is to improve 
the quality of life and health of older individuals who live either 
independently or with others, with the aim of reducing their need for 
more intensive care or institutionalization. There is considerable 
variability in the definitions and scope of home care services 
provided between countries. Examples of care services provided in 
the reviewed countries include: (i) ADLs (e.g. eating; bathing, hygiene 
and toileting; dressing and laundry; and walking and transferring 
positions and locations); (ii) instrumental activities of daily living 
(IADLs) (e.g. medication, communication, house cleaning, shopping 
and meal preparation, transportation and paying bills); (iii) health-
related tasks (partial overlap with IADLs, e.g. transportation to 
medical appointments or to purchase medication, administration of 
medication at home; screening and early detection of conditions; 
coordination of health care services provided by other professionals, 
including occupational and physical therapy; and provision of/
assistance with medical devices and equipment); and (iv) other 
services (e.g. social interaction; training of family caregivers on 
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providing direct care; development of care plan; physical 
improvements to living space to reduce risk of falls; respite and/or 
day care for the benefit of other family members; and palliative 
care).

3.2.4	Financing mechanisms and user contributions

Most of the community and home-based programmes reviewed here 
are funded through general taxation, either through funding 
mechanisms for health care and health insurance (Indonesia and 
Thailand) or for social care systems (Malaysia, Serbia and Uruguay). 
For example, Thailand’s community-based LTC programme is jointly 
funded by national and local governments following the funding 
mechanisms of the health care system. A local health fund receives 
funding from both the national universal care scheme (funded by 
general taxation through the National Health Security Office) and the 
local government (through a local administration organization). 
Serbia’s day care and home-based care are funded by local 
governments using the funding mechanisms of the social care 
system through the Ministry of Labour, Employment, Veteran and 
Social Policy. Financing mechanisms also vary by the level of 
government: programmes in Malaysia and Uruguay are funded by 
the national government, while the budgets for the programmes in 
Indonesia, Serbia and Thailand are shared between the national and 
local governments. Some programmes rely on user cost-sharing, 
although this information is not widely available. 
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Table 3.2. Home-based and community-based programmes

Country, 
programme

Financing Beneficiaries Benefits Service providers

Indonesia, 
voluntary 
community 
groups 
supporting 
families (Bina 
Keluarga 
Lanjutusia)

Can apply for operational 
funding from their local 
government; some grant 
support from national 
social or health ministries, 
including transport costs 
for informal workers 

Benefitting > 625 
000 older people 
annually (in 2017) 
(37)

Leaders of groups: directly 
provide LTC care (ADLs and IADLs) 
to their members via home visits; 
provide counselling to associated 
families, including training on how 
to provide direct LTC care to the 
older people at home; and serve 
as part of the safety-net and 
primary care referral system (e.g. 
check on members who miss 
regular meetings)

Voluntary groups across the 
country of informal community-
based workers, operating under 
the guidance of the Family 
Planning Board, Ministry of Health; 
services implemented in 
coordination with health care 
centres and district-level health 
officers and social affairs officers; 
groups (minimum 20 members 
and two volunteers) formed or 
hosted by community 
organizations or clinics (53); 
payment through grants

Indonesia, 
publicly funded 
LTC (Posyandu 
Lansia)

General tax revenue 
through the funding 
mechanisms of the 
national health insurance 
system; Ministry of Health 
transfers to local 
governments and the 
operating budgets of 
Puskesmas; actual 
allocation relies on 
prioritization by local 
authorities

Any older person can 
participate, although 
it is targeted at older 
people with low or 
moderate 
dependency

Public, community-based 
activities providing health 
promotion and screening 
activities for older people in the 
catchment area of a public health 
clinic; services include health 
outreach and referral services, 
identifying problems with ADLs 
and IADLs, mental health, body 
weight, blood pressure, glucose 
and haemoglobin levels, and 
health counselling (39) 

Public health clinics
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Country, 
programme

Financing Beneficiaries Benefits Service providers

Malaysia, home 
help services 
programme 
(Khidmat Bantu 
di Rumah)

General tax revenue 
through the funding 
mechanisms of the social 
welfare system; no user 
contributions

Targeted at people 
aged ≥ 60 years who 
live alone without an 
income or family 
support (54); can 
include bedridden 
older people

Home visits for ADLs and IADLs, 
including accompanying people to 
medical appointments or when 
buying groceries

3178 paid volunteers from private 
and community organizations (as 
of 2022) (54)

Serbia, day care 
and home-based 
care

Primarily funded by local 
government through the 
funding mechanisms of 
the social care system; 
source: 83% local 
government, 7% national 
budget, 3% donors, 7% 
users in form of token 
co-payment

15 064 older people 
(2015) in ~ 84% of 
local communities; 
estimated to reach 
1.2% of the older 
population (55,56) 

Home-based care, 2–3 hours per 
day for IADLs

Social care organizations licensed 
by Ministry of Labour, 
Employment, Veteran and Social 
Policy (e.g. centres for social work 
within system of social security 
delivery, local communities, 
organizations of civil society, 
NGOs), few are commercial/
private; in 2018, 29 cities and 
municipalities had service 
providers (44) 

Thailand, 
community-
based LTC 

A local health fund 
receives funding from 
both the national 
universal care scheme 
(funded by general 
taxation) and the local 
government through the 
health care system 
funding mechanisms 

People aged ≥ 60 
years with 
dependency; care 
managers assess 
level of dependency 
and family support, 
and develop care 
plans (57,58) 

Home visits of 2–8 hours a week 
by volunteer caregivers and case 
managers to support care 
management; care with ADLs and 
IADLs; conduct health promotion 
and detection and coordinate with 
health services; training for family 
caregivers 

Paid or volunteer caregivers for 
direct provision of LTC home care 
for 7–15 older people, although 
most care is intended to be 
provided by families; community 
caregivers are supervised by care 
managers who are nurses, 
physiotherapists or social workers, 
who also receive special training
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Country, 
programme

Financing Beneficiaries Benefits Service providers

Uruguay, home 
care assistants 
(Programa de 
Asistentes 
Personales)

General taxation and 
co-payments, through the 
funding mechanisms of 
the National Care System 
(which includes older 
population care, child 
care, early child 
development and 
disability care)  

Limited to those 
aged ≥ 80 years with 
severe dependency 
residing in their 
home; must have 
citizenship or 10 
years of residence in 
the country

Help with basic needs of daily life 
(eating, cleaning, dressing, getting 
around, work, study and 
recreation); maximum of 80 hours/
month

Formal home care assistance; 
beneficiaries select a registered 
qualified care assistant (without 
close relationship to beneficiary) 
from official list, and wages are 
paid directly by the national Social 
Security Fund (46)

ADL: activity of daily living; IADL: instrumental activity of daily living; LTC: long-term care; NGO: nongovernmental organization.
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Cash allowances are a common component of social welfare 
payment in many countries. These programmes offer monetary 
assistance to vulnerable individuals and families experiencing 
financial hardship or difficulty in accessing necessities such as food, 
housing and health care services. Cash allowances are also common 
in LTC systems; these are monetary allowances disbursed to LTC care 
recipients on a regular basis to help with access to necessary LTC 
services and reduce the LTC-associated financial burden. 

Cash-for-care schemes have become increasingly popular in HICs 
since the 1990s, particularly in European nations. For instance, in 
Netherlands (Kingdom of the) and Sweden (Hemvårdsbidrag), cash-
for-care schemes were introduced to make the existing supply-
oriented and expensive LTC systems more flexible. These schemes 
feature prominently in the new LTC systems in Austria and France. In 
Italy, the cash-for-care schemes reflect the traditional approach 
(cash transfers) to social protection principles. These schemes can be 
tax-based as in Austria, France and Italy, or insurance-based as in 
Netherlands (Kingdom of the), with the primary goal of providing 
free choice and autonomy to choose among various care options and 
providers. The schemes also recognize the significance of informal 
care and family responsibility by allowing beneficiaries to 
compensate or employ family members. Finally, cash-for-care 
schemes are often less expensive than traditional services, making 
them an attractive alternative for cost containment. 

In contrast to the practices in many European countries, Uruguay’s 
cash-for-care scheme focuses on providing LTC in a formal setting 
(Table 4.1) (22,44,46,54,55,59,60). The National Care System was 
initially established in 2015 to provide childcare and was later 
expanded in 2017 to include LTC services for older people. The 
programme is financed through general taxes from the central 
government, as well as an income-based co-payment. Under the 
National Care System, beneficiaries receive a monthly allowance for 
up to 80 hours of personal assistance in the form of home care 
services. These services must be provided by trained and certified 
care workers who have no family relationship to the beneficiary. 
Formal home care is provided through contracting and registration 
with formal care providers, necessary because of the decreasing 
availability of informal care from family members. This is particularly 
true for female family caregivers driven by changes in family 
structure, greater female participation in the labour market, and 
shifting social norms that no longer place the sole responsibility for 
caregiving on women (61). The National Care System primarily 
supports home care as opposed to residential care, which is more 
expensive. Although the system is intended to be universal and 
available to those aged 65 years and older, benefits are currently 
limited to individuals aged 80 years and older because of financial 
constraints (46).
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Table 4.1. Cash allowances in LTC and social welfare targeting older population

Country, 
programme

Universal or 
means-tested

Eligibility Financing 
sources

Governance 
arrangements 

Use of 
allowance

Principles Population 
coverage

Amount

China,  
old-age 
allowance 

Mostly 
means-tested 
(income and 
assets), 
targeted at 
low-income 
population

Aged ≥ 80 years; 
no requirement 
on dependency; 
enrolment by 
voluntary 
application and 
government 
identification

General tax 
revenue 

Ministry of 
Civil Affairs; 
local level

Free to use Social 
protection

NR Varies by 
province/city, 
typically US$ 
14–44/month, 
increasing with 
age (7–22% of 
global poverty 
line)

Malaysia, 
Bantuan 
Warga Emas 
(Senior 
Citizen 
Assistance)

Means-tested, 
targeting the 
poorest 40% 
of the 
population

Aged ≥ 60 years; 
no requirement 
on dependency; 
either living 
alone or without 
financial support 
from family; 
enrolment by 
voluntary 
application

General tax 
revenue

Branch offices 
of Ministry of 
Women, 
Family and 
Community 
Development, 
Department of 
Social Welfare 

Free to use Social 
protection 
(safety nets)

~ 140 000 
older people 
annually in 
2022 (54,59) 

A living 
allowance of 
US$ 108/month 
(60% of global 
poverty line)

Serbia,  
cash 
allowance

Universal No age 
requirement; 
dependent 
individuals with 
physical and/or 
mental 
impairments

Dependent on 
employment 
status:  
(i) pension 
and invalidity 
fund for the 
employed and 
pensioned; or 
(ii) national 
budget for 
unemployed

Ministry of 
Labour, 
Employment, 
Veteran and 
Social Affairs; 
Old-Age and 
Disability 
Insurance 
Fund; national 
level

Recipients 
have no 
obligation to 
report on 
how it is 
spent; 
described as 
an allowance 
to support 
informal 
caregivers 
(55) 

Social 
protection

96 635 older 
people 
(estimated 
coverage of 
7.14% of the 
older 
population) in 
2016 (22) 

Average basic 
allowance (2019) 
US$ 150 for 
employed (50–
75% of global 
poverty line) or 
pensioned and 
US$ 96 for the 
unemployed; 
increased 
allowance US$ 
260 (44) 
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Country, 
programme

Universal or 
means-tested

Eligibility Financing 
sources

Governance 
arrangements 

Use of 
allowance

Principles Population 
coverage

Amount

South 
Africa, 
old-age 
pension

Means-tested 
for income 
and asset

Aged ≥ 60 years General 
revenue

South African 
Social Security 
Agency; 
national level

Free to use Social 
protection 
(social 
pension)

73% of the 
population 
aged ≥ 60 
years

Approximately 
US$ 110/month 
(50% of global 
poverty line)

Thailand, 
old-age 
allowance

Universal 
(expanded to 
universal 
scheme from 
2009)

Older people 
aged ≥ 60 years 
(excluding 
government and 
private 
employees)

Elderly Fund 
(from 2% of 
sin taxes 
capped at  
US$ 115.6 
million and 
payment from 
donors); 
budget in 
2017 was US$ 
1870 million 

Not available Free to use Social 
protection 
(social 
pension)

8.2 million 
recipients in 
2017

US$ 17–29/
month, 
increasing with 
age (< 4% of 
average 
household 
income; 8–15% 
of global 
poverty line)

Uruguay, 
National 
Care 
System

Universal Aged ≥ 65 years 
with 
dependency 
(physically and 
mentally); care 
dependency 
assessed using a 
standardized 
instrument  
(13 groups of 
ADLs and four 
variables)

General 
taxation  
from central 
government; 
95% income-
tested  
and 5% 
co-payment

National Care 
Council (an 
inter-
institutional 
body), 
although 
political 
responsibility 
lies with 
Ministry of 
Social 
Development

Monthly 
allowance for 
up to 80 
hours of 
home care 
(personal 
assistance)

LTC support 6125 
recipients  
(~ 1.2% of 
those aged ≥ 
65 years) in 
2020, 86%  
of whom 
received full 
subsidy 
(household 
income of  
< US$ 343/
month) (46)

NR

ADL: activity of daily living; LTC: long-term care; NR: not reported; US$: United States dollars.
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The amount of freedom that recipients have in determining how 
their care allowance is utilized varies between countries; for 
example, care allowance in France can only be spent on a particular 
care package identified by a team of professionals based on the 
recipient’s needs, and care allowance in Uruguay is restricted to 
certified home care assistants. In contrast, in countries such as 
Austria, Italy and Netherlands (Kingdom of the), recipients have 
greater flexibility. In Netherlands (Kingdom of the), the personal 
budget can be utilized for all three types of care (i.e. residential, 
community nursing and home care). Budget holders have the option 
to pay informal caregivers, such as family members and 
acquaintances, at a lower rate than formal caregivers.

Cash-for-care schemes are rare in LMICs (with the exception of the 
LTCI pilot in Shanghai, China). Instead, many cash allowance 
programmes fall within the broader category of social protection 
and are not specifically targeted at LTC. For example, some countries 
offer old-age allowance programmes that serve as supplementary 
social pensions in places where formal pensions are limited (e.g. 
Thailand’s old-age allowance programme). Other programmes are 
means tested and aimed at alleviating poverty among low-income 
older people, such as China’s old-age allowance, Malaysia’s Bantuan 
Warga Emas and South Africa’s old-age pension (see Table 4.1 for 
programme features). Beneficiaries are free to use their cash 
allowance at their discretion for, for example, LTC services, food, 
transportation or other needs. 

The criteria for entitlement and eligibility differ between cash 
allowance programmes and vary by income, age and level of 
dependency. Thailand extended its old-age allowance programme in 
2009 from means tested to a universal scheme that covers all 
citizens, and Serbia has a cash allowance programme for individuals 
of all ages with dependency needs. Most programmes grant benefits 
to those aged 60 or 65 years and older; China is the exception, 
where cash allowances are only available to those aged 80 years and 
older. Certain programmes require a specific degree of dependency 
to qualify for the cash allowance. Additionally, Malaysia only offers 
cash allowance to older individuals who live alone or lack financial 
assistance from their family. 

Tax-based financing is the most common method of financing cash 
allowance programmes offered under social protection principles 
(e.g. Malaysia and South Africa). In most cases, programmes are 
funded through general taxation. However, Thailand’s old-age 
allowance is funded through an Elderly Fund, which receives funding 
from sin taxes and donor contributions. The responsibility for 
funding the programme can either fall on local or central 
governments. Typically, the amount of cash allowance offered by 
unconditional programmes – where recipients have full discretion in 
deciding how their funds are used – is modest and insufficient to 
cover LTC. Assessments of South Africa’s old-age pension scheme 
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(60) have revealed that the programme may not provide the 
intended benefit for the older population as recipients often use the 
allowance to support unemployed children, grandchildren and other 
relatives.

To summarize, cash allowance programmes can be divided into two 
types: cash-for-care schemes that explicitly support LTC, and cash 
allowances that are provided as welfare payments. HICs have mostly 
adopted cash-for-care schemes to allow beneficiaries to access LTC 
services that are cost-effective and responsive to individuals’ needs, 
while recognizing the role of informal caregivers. These schemes are 
effective in financing LTC, while promoting ageing in place, 
leveraging informal care and containing costs. In LMICs, cash 
allowance programmes are mostly used for poverty alleviation and 
as social pensions. However, the benefits provided are usually 
insufficient to cover the cost of LTC services.



5

LTCI programmes



46	 �Public provision and financing of long-term care: case studies in middle- and  
high-income countries 

5.1	 LTCI in Japan, Netherlands (Kingdom of the) 
and Singapore
LTC services in some HICs are financed through mandatory LTCI, 
which bears many similarities in its design features to social health 
insurance (1,62). LTCI plays a primary role in financing LTC in Japan 
and Netherlands (Kingdom of the), while in Singapore a hybrid 
approach of combining LTC (through CareShield Life) and means-
tested public subsidies for services has been adopted. Despite 
varying types of benefits, the LTCI programmes in these three 
countries have similar features in terms of financing, pooling and 
eligibility rules. 

All three programmes are financed through a combination of 
individual and government contributions. In Japan, individual 
contributions collected through payroll taxes make up 50% of LTCI 
premiums, with the government contributing another 50% between 
national (25%), prefecture (12.5%) and municipal (12.5%) 
jurisdictions (63). In Netherlands (Kingdom of the), LTCI is financed 
through a combination of premiums collected through payroll tax 
(9.7% of income), income- and asset-related user fees, and 
government subsidies. Singapore’s CareShield premiums are paid by 
individuals using funds from their medical savings accounts 
(Medisave); the government subsidizes premiums for low-income 
individuals. 

Eligibility criteria for LTC benefits are similar for all three countries: 
eligibility is based on assessed need and is not restricted to older 
people, and the generosity of benefits depends on the assessed 
level of care needs. However, the benefit packages differ between 
the countries. In Japan, LTCI only covers in-kind services; in 
Netherlands (Kingdom of the), beneficiaries can choose between 
receiving LTC services or a cash allowance (known as cash-for-care) 
that can be used to pay informal caregivers such as family members; 
and Singapore’s CareShield provides a monthly cash payout to 
beneficiaries for the duration of an individuals’ disability.  

5.2	 LTCI pilots in China

Among the MICs reviewed here, China is the only country that has 
adopted an LTCI programme. To address the challenges posed by a 
rapidly ageing population and the weakening of family-based elderly 
care, China formally rolled out public LTCI pilot programmes in 15 
cities across the country in 2016. As of 2019, these 15 pilot 
programmes have enrolled over 88.5 million people, with 
approximately 426 000 individuals receiving benefits (64). In 2020, 
the LTCI pilots were expanded to include an additional 34 cities. 
China opted to finance LTC services in the same way that pension 
and social health insurance are funded, namely from pooled 
(insurance) funds and individual accounts. All three social insurance 
programmes – health, pension and LTC – are overseen by the 



5. LTCI programmes� 47 

Ministry of Human Resources and Social Security, and the National 
Healthcare Security Administration. The country’s approach to 
financing LTC is affected by previous decisions made with regards to 
the financing of health care.

Below, key features of the LTCI systems in four cities are described 
and compared, namely: Anqing in Anhui province located in east 
China; Changchun of Jilin province in north-east China; Guangzhou 
in the southern province of Guangdong, and Shanghai in east China. 
These cities were chosen to provide a representation of the ageing 
demographic and economic development of different regions in 
China. Our discussion on LTCI programme features references the 
study by Feng et al. (32), which provides an in-depth discussion of 
China’s LTCI pilots. 

Table 5.1 summarizes the programme features of the LTCI schemes in 
the four cities. The programmes vary in terms of the insured 
population. At the start of the pilots, most of the 15 pilot 
programmes begin with providing social health insurance to urban 
employees in the UEBMI scheme. As the programmes have evolved, 
some pilot cities have expanded the target population to include 
residents enrolled in the URBMI scheme as well as rural residents in 
the New Cooperative Medical Insurance (NCMS) scheme. The URBMI 
and NCMS subsequently merged in 2009 to form the Urban and 
Rural Resident Basic Medical Insurance (URRBMI) scheme. In the four 
cities reviewed, Anqing and Guangzhou provide insurance coverage 
only to enrolees in the UEBMI. Changchun covers residents enrolled 
in the URBMI in addition to UEBMI. In Shanghai, an economically 
prosperous city but one in which one quarter of its population is 
aged 60 years and older, LTCI covers both urban and rural residents. 

5.2.1	Financing mechanism and revenue raising 

The sustainability of a social insurance system depends crucially on 
sustainable financing. Accordingly, the central government 
recommended that pilot cities explore a multichannel financing 
mechanism for LTCI, and fundraising should be based on local 
conditions and needs. It advised pilots to follow the general 
principle of “balancing revenues and expenses, with a small surplus 
maintained” (65) to ensure financial stability. The pilot cities 
designed a financing mechanism that combines funds from multiple 
sources: premiums, payroll taxes, individual/employer contributions 
and government subsidies. However, individual and employer 
contributions are generally very low in practice, and LTCI 
programmes rely heavily on contributions collected through the 
medical insurance funding pool. For example, all of the LTCI funding 
in Changchun and Guangzhou, and two thirds of the funding in 
Anqing, is derived from the UEBMI. If the basic medical insurance 
funds are in deficit, local governments can provide subsidies to the 
LTCI fund.
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Table 5.1. Population characteristics and LTCI design features in four Chinese pilot cities

City (province) Average 
GDP per 
capita 
(US$)

Population 
aged ≥ 60 
years (%)

Financing 
mechanism

Eligibility Benefit package and cost-sharing [provider payment 
mode] (33)

Health care 
facility

Residential 
facility

Community or 
home

Anqing (Anhui) 9 232 21 US$ 3 per person 
per year (UEBMI); 
US$ 1.5 per 
person per year 
(from individual) 

Severely disabled Nursing: 40% 
co-payment,  
cap US$ 7/day 
(3% of local 
average income) 
[contracted,  
per diem]  
Daily living: NA

Nursing: 50% 
co-payment,  
cap US$ 5.8/day 
(3% of local 
average income) 
[contracted,  
per diem]  
Daily living: NA

Nursing:  
(i) contracted:  
cap US$ 109/
month (2% of 
average income) 
[per diem];  
(ii) non-
contracted:  
US$ 2/day (1% of 
average income) 
[not directly paid] 
Daily living: NA

Changchun 
(Jilin)

11 348 21 0.5% payroll 
(UEBMI);  
US$ 4 per person 
per year (URBMI)

Severely disabled Nursing: 10% 
co-payment 
(UEBMI);  
20% co-payment 
(URBMI) [per 
admission, based 
on disease]  
Daily living: NA

Nursing: 10% 
co-payment 
(UEBMI); 20% 
co-payment 
(URBMI)  
[per diem]  
Daily living: NA

Nursing: NA  
Daily living: NA
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City (province) Average 
GDP per 
capita 
(US$)

Population 
aged ≥ 60 
years (%)

Financing 
mechanism

Eligibility Benefit package and cost-sharing [provider payment 
mode] (33)

Health care 
facility

Residential 
facility

Community or 
home

Guangzhou 
(Guangdong)

21 979 16 US$ 19 per 
person per year 
(UEBMI) 

Severely disabled; 
dementia plus 
moderate 
disability

Nursing: 25% 
co-payment, cap 
US$ 145/month 
(2% of local 
average income) 
[FFS]  
Daily living: 25% 
co-payment, cap 
US$ 17/day [FFS]

Nursing: 25% 
co-payment, cap 
US$ 145/month 
(2% of local 
average income) 
[FFS]  
Daily living: 25% 
co-payment, cap 
US$ 17.4/day [FFS]

Nursing: 10% 
co-payment, cap 
US$ 145/month 
(2% of local 
average income) 
[FFS]  
Daily living: 10% 
co-payment, cap 
US$ 16.7/day [FFS]

Shanghai (NA)  25 160 25 UEBMI enrolees: 
1% of payroll 
(UEBMI); URRBMI 
enrolees: from 
URRBMI

Aged ≥ 60 years, 
assessed and 
certified for level 
2–6 disability

Nursing: 20% 
co-payment [FFS] 
Daily living: NA

Nursing: 15% 
co-payment [FFS] 
Daily living: 15% 
co-payment [per 
diem]

Nursing: 10% 
co-payment;  
3, 5 and 7 hours/
week for levels 
2–3, 4 and 5–6, 
respectively; cash 
alternative to 
services for those 
eligible for > 6 
months of care 
Daily living: NA

FFS: fee-for-service; GDP: gross domestic product; LTCI: long-term care insurance; NA: not applicable; UEBMI: Urban Employee Basic Medical Insurance; 
URBMI: Urban Resident Basic Medical Insurance; URRMBI: Urban and Rural Resident Basic Medical Insurance; US$: United States dollars.
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The levels of premiums also vary considerably between cities, partly 
because of differences in income levels and population age 
structure. Premiums also differ in how they are structured: in some 
cities, premiums are stipulated in dollar amounts; in other cities they 
are calculated as a percentage of payroll income. The level of 
premiums in Guangzhou amounts to US$ 19 per person per year; in 
the less economically prosperous city of Anqing, premiums are 
significantly lower at US$ 4.5 (33). Premiums are calculated as a 
percentage of payroll income in Changchun and Shanghai at 0.5% 
and 1%, respectively. 

5.2.2	Eligibility 

The conditions for eligibility for receipt of LTCI benefits vary 
between LTCI pilot cities. In Anqing and Changchun, individuals must 
have a severe disability (e.g. caused by age, illness or injury) and 
must have been in their state of disability for at least 6 months to be 
eligible for LTCI benefits. Shanghai stipulates an age requirement of 
60 years and older to be eligible; in Guangzhou, people with 
moderate disability are eligible for benefits. Some pilot cities do not 
consider dementia and psychological conditions to be eligible, 
excluding many individuals from the LTCI system and resulting in 
significant levels of unmet need for LTC. 

There is no uniform or standardized assessment tool. All pilot cities 
either designate a government agency or hire a third-party evaluator 
to assess physical impairment based on limitations in performing 
various ADLs. Of the 15 cities, six cities (Anqing, Changchun, 
Chengde, Jingmen, Nantong and Shihezi) use the Barthel scale (33); a 
score of lower than 40 (on a 100-point scale) indicates severe 
disability, meaning that the person is eligible to receive LTCI benefit. 

5.2.3	Benefits and cost-sharing

All LTCI pilot programmes provide in-kind benefits. As shown in 
Table 5.1, the programmes generally cover three types of service: 
(i) those provided at designated health care facilities; (ii) those 
provided at designated residential facilities; and (iii) home care. 
Features such as service benefit, payment cap, co-payment and type 
of service vary considerably between cities and for different levels 
of assessed disability. In Changchun, the co-payment is higher for 
URBMI enrolees compared with UEBMI enrolees (20% versus 10%). 
In Shanghai, beneficiaries are eligible for more hours of care if they 
have a higher level of disability (for which six levels exist). 

The generosity of the benefits can also vary between different 
service providers, as well as the types of services. For example, the 
LTCI in Guangzhou covers 75% of the cost of nursing care received 
at health care facilities, and 90% of the cost for nursing care 
provided at the community level. The payment cap for nursing care 
is US$ 145/month, whereas the payment cap for assistance with 
daily living is US$ 17/day (33). In theory, LTCI covers 70% of the 
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costs. However, in many pilot programmes, the co-payment is high 
and the payment cap is low. In Anqing, the co-payments for nursing 
care in health care facilities and residential facilities are 40% and 
50%, respectively. There is also a per diem payment cap of less than 
US$ 8. 

Some pilot cities such as Qingdao (not included in Table 5.1) offer a 
more comprehensive range of services. These services include basic 
life care and medical care for people with complete disability and 
severe dementia, as well as training to maintain body functions for 
those with mild to moderate dementia and semi-disabled 
individuals. 

Cash benefits are included in the Shanghai pilot programme, the 
only city to do so. Beneficiaries receive cash payments directly, 
which they can use to purchase LTC or to pay informal caregivers or 
family members. Cash-for-care schemes are found in a number of 
HICs including Belgium, Netherlands (Kingdom of the), Spain and the 
United Kingdom of Great Britain and Northern Ireland (62,66) 
(Chapter 4). 

5.2.4	Service provision 

In terms of service providers, LTCIs are responsible for the 
management of service providers ranging from contracts and 
finance, service provision, standards and quality, and supervision 
and audit. Designated LTCI service providers comprise health care 
facilities, residential facilities and, in some cities, community senior 
care service institutions, health care centres, and other community- 
and home-based LTC facilities. There is an increasing reliance on 
private-sector service providers as demand for LTC services has 
risen sharply, especially in highly specialized functions such as 
disability and needs assessment. Payment modalities differ between 
pilot cities and type of service providers. In Guangzhou and 
Shanghai the majority of the nursing care services are paid on a 
fee-for-service basis; in contrast, in Anqing and Changchun nursing 
care providers are paid a per diem rate (Table 5.1). 
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Approaches to publicly financing LTC services vary between 
countries, in terms of how public funds are organized and allocated 
as well as the extent of coverage for people in need of LTC (67). 
When designing their public LTC financing systems, countries need 
to take into account several important considerations, including: 
whether the government should means-test eligibility or offer 
universal coverage; whether the government should provide services 
directly or instead act as an insurer or third-party payer; whether the 
financing should be structured nationally (centralized) or locally 
(decentralized); and the degree to which the financing of LTC is 
separate from that of medical care services (68). In this chapter, the 
advantages and disadvantages of these various design features of 
public financing for LTC are discussed, drawing on the experiences of 
HICs with established LTC systems. How countries choose to finance 
LTC will have significant implications on equity and fairness, access, 
financial protection, affordability and sustainability. It is important 
that these factors are carefully considered when designing LTC 
financing systems, to ensure that the well-being of individuals and 
their families are maximized while promoting affordability, fairness 
and efficiency. 

6.1 	 Means-tested versus universal coverage

6.1.1 	Advantages and disadvantages 

In LTC systems that primarily use means testing to determine 
eligibility for publicly funded LTC benefits, coverage is limited to a 
small number of individuals who meet certain income and/or asset 
thresholds; the majority of individuals who require LTC services pay 
privately for the care and services they need. In means-tested LTC 
systems, the dominant source of public financing is typically 
taxation. In comparison, in LTC systems with universal coverage (i.e. 
LTC for all individuals with demonstrated needs) the dominant 
source of public financing can be either social insurance (as in 
Germany, Japan and the Republic of Korea) or taxation (as in 
Denmark, Finland, Norway and Sweden).

In countries that primarily operate means-tested LTC financing 
programmes (e.g. England and the United States of America (USA)), 
public benefits are limited to low-income members of the 
population who meet certain eligibility requirements determined by 
incomes and assets (67). The underlying premise is that the primary 
responsibility for LTC of people with disabilities is with individuals 
and their families, and that government support should only be 
viewed as a last resort for those who are unable to provide for 
themselves (68). As such, means-tested LTC financing systems serve 
as public welfare safety-net programmes providing social protection 
for the most vulnerable members of society.

Means-tested LTC programmes have some advantages. These types 
of programmes target individuals who are most in need of 



6. Assessing advantages and disadvantages� 55 

assistance; prioritizing and directing resources to individuals with 
limited means can assist with controlling costs, an important 
consideration for countries faced with limited fiscal capacity and 
constrained budgets for financing LTC programmes. Means-tested 
programmes can also reduce disparities in access to LTC services by 
directing assistance to individuals who fall below specific incomes 
or asset thresholds. Means testing helps to bridge the gap in access 
arising from socioeconomic inequalities, promoting more equitable 
access to LTC services.

However, means-tested programmes also have many shortcomings 
and disadvantages. First, the use of a means-tested, and often 
stringent, threshold for determining eligibility always creates a group 
of individuals whose income is not low enough to qualify for public 
funding but who are not wealthy enough to afford the costs of 
needed care, raising concerns about fairness and equity in LTC 
access. Second, the receipt of means-tested welfare benefits often 
comes with a sense of stigma rather than entitlement. Third, means 
testing carries a high administrative burden associated with 
monitoring eligibility and benefits (68). Fourth, a means-tested 
approach cannot prevent catastrophic out-of-pocket costs for 
medical and LTC services, as individuals often have to spend 
significant amounts of their incomes and/or deplete their assets 
before qualifying for the means-tested eligibility and benefits (68). 
Furthermore, public funds for means-tested LTC programmes are 
usually allocated from the general government budgets, which are 
subject to fiscal pressures and shortfalls and can be unstable or 
unpredictable. The limitations of means-tested LTC financing 
programmes are therefore substantial, leaving large gaps in 
coverage for the vast majority of the middle-class population (67).

The alternative to means testing is for governments to design 
financing systems aimed at achieving universal LTC coverage. In such 
systems, LTC services are financed primarily through either public 
social insurance (as in Germany, Japan, Luxembourg, Netherlands 
(Kingdom of the) and the Republic of Korea) or general taxation (as in 
Denmark, Finland, Norway and Sweden). Underpinning this approach 
is the premise that the government should take the lead in mobilizing 
resources to ensure that all people with disabilities are eligible for 
the LTC services they need, regardless of financial status (68). This 
approach recognizes that the financial risks associated with LTC use 
are so great for the vast majority of older people and their families 
that a collective arrangement for social protection against these risks 
is imperative. As such, social solidarity is highly valued, and universal 
access to LTC is viewed in the same way as an entitlement to basic 
medical care. Since everyone pays into the system and receives 
benefits once meeting certain disability criteria, it essentially creates 
an entitlement, ensures equitable access and eliminates the stigma 
associated with means-tested LTC support (67).
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6.1.2	Public social insurance approach to financing 
universal LTC 

The main advantages of a public social insurance LTC financing 
system include broad-based social contributions, typically through a 
combination of employee payroll taxes, employer contributions and 
government subsidies. Because this financing approach requires 
mandatory participation and is built on, and linked to, the payroll 
system that covers the formal sector of the economy, it ensures a 
broad risk pool and stable revenue stream for LTC financing.

Among the potential issues and challenges, the ongoing costs and 
administrative burden of a government-managed public social 
insurance programme for LTC financing can be a concern, as is the 
long-term sustainability of this financing mechanism. Public social 
insurance is essentially a pay-as-you-go system. With population 
ageing the ratio of the working-age population to retirees is forecast 
to decrease in many countries in the future, weakening the payroll 
tax base and the risk pool. In addition, the payroll-based 
contribution system tends to exclude workers who are employed in 
informal sectors of the economy, prevalent in many developing 
settings. The changing employment structure in many countries, 
such as a labour market characterized by increasing short-term and 
freelance contracts (i.e. a gig economy), poses additional challenges 
for payroll-based contributions (67).

6.1.3	Tax-based financing for universal LTC coverage

Tax-based LTC financing models have the advantage of a broader 
revenue base relative to the payroll-based social insurance financing 
model discussed in the previous section: taxes are ubiquitous in all 
countries and levied in many forms such as those on individual 
incomes, properties and consumption, and business corporate taxes.

However, the disadvantages and limitations of tax-based financing 
for LTC are also considerable. First, there are limits to the willingness 
of taxpayers to contribute to the costs of LTC through tax increases, 
which are often politically unpopular. Second, there is no guarantee 
that a stable and sufficient share of tax revenues will be allocated 
for LTC financing, unless mandated by strong and long-lasting 
legislations that can be practically difficult to establish. Moreover, 
because most often taxation is locally based, tax revenues – and the 
portion of them dedicated to LTC financing – will vary greatly 
between administrative jurisdictions and localities as a result of 
uneven socioeconomic development and resources, creating or 
exacerbating regional disparities in LTC access.

6.2	 Direct provision versus purchasing 

Although LTC services are predominantly financed by public 
resources in HICs with established LTC systems, actual services can 
be provided directly by government agencies (e.g. in Denmark, 
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Finland, Norway and Sweden) or nongovernmental organizations (as 
in the USA, where private for-profit service providers dominate the 
LTC landscape). The goal of government ownership is to focus more 
on care provision rather than considering whether an activity is 
profitable, which can be taken as an advantage but not without 
drawbacks. Where government agencies provide the services, the 
fact that the government is both the service provider and the payer 
can lead to inefficiencies in spending and operations (68).

In countries such as Germany, Japan and the USA, where government 
ownership of LTC providers is uncommon, the government functions 
as a third-party payer or insurer to reimburse private-sector service 
providers for publicly covered services (68). In financing systems 
that operate as third-party payers, the government are responsible 
for (and burdened with) developing systems of enrolling eligible 
providers; determining eligible beneficiaries; setting reimbursement 
rates; monitoring compliance with quality, administrative and fiscal 
standards; and paying providers for services (68).

Nongovernmental entities providing LTC services include both non-
profit organizations and for-profit companies. The theory motivating 
privatization is that competing providers will provide more choices 
and care options to consumers at a lower cost, with more flexibility 
and with greater consideration of the needs of consumers (68). 
However, the quality of care by for-profit providers has frequently 
been a concern given the tendency of these providers to focus on 
profit-seeking rather than the needs of their clients.

In practice, most countries (including HICs and LMICs) have opted to 
contract out LTC services fully or partially to private non-profit or 
for-profit organizations, and the global trend is to move away from 
direct public provision of services (69). Where public funding is 
involved, various forms of public–private partnership are commonly 
used to engage private-sector service providers in the LTC system. 
As contracting out for LTC services through public–private 
partnerships is increasingly the norm in many countries, the related 
transaction costs – such as those incurred in setting up contractual 
arrangements and quality standards, monitoring provider 
performance and ensuring regulatory compliance – will also 
inevitably increase, which could offset efficiency gains from the 
marketization and privatization of LTC provision (70).

6.3	 Centralized (national) versus decentralized 
(subnational)

A key consideration in the design of LTC systems is the level of 
government responsible for financing and delivery. Some HICs, such 
as Germany and Japan, operate more centralized and nationalized 
LTC systems in terms of financing and determination of eligibility, 
benefits and reimbursement rates, although subnational and local 
governments are also involved to a lesser degree (68). This 



58	 �Public provision and financing of long-term care: case studies in middle- and  
high-income countries 

centralized approach can be justified on two grounds. First, a 
uniform national programme helps achieve horizontal equity 
between geographical areas, that is, national rules help ensure that 
similarly situated individuals in different geographical areas receive 
the same benefits. Second, developing a single LTC system nationally 
may involve lower administrative costs because programme rules 
and systems need to be developed only once, and subnational and 
local governments do not need to reinvent procedures and systems 
(68). However, a centralized system can be bureaucratic and 
unresponsive to local conditions, needs and preferences.

Other HICs, such as Canada, Netherlands (Kingdom of the), Sweden, 
the United Kingdom and the USA, rely primarily on subnational 
governments to design and administer their LTC systems, often with 
substantial policy guidance from the national government (68). 
There are good reasons to justify this decentralized approach. First, 
local authorities and jurisdictions (states, provinces and 
municipalities) are directly and heavily involved in the development 
of various social services in many countries. A localized approach 
can establish necessary links between LTC and other services often 
needed by people with disabilities. Second, LTC is an intensely 
personal service involving decisions about how individuals want to 
live their lives. The planning and delivery of services can therefore 
be influenced by local circumstances, norms and values as well as by 
local preferences of the disabled people, their caregivers and 
providers. Finally, because subnational and local governments are 
less driven to routinize their decision-making process, and because 
individual cases loom larger in the policy process, locally designed 
and administered programmes are arguably less rigid and 
bureaucratic than centrally run programmes. However, a 
decentralized approach runs the risk of creating or institutionalizing 
disparities between regions and individuals, and may result in 
inefficiencies as each local government must decide how to design 
and manage its system (68).

6.4 	 Financing for medical care versus LTC

In virtually all countries, individuals with disabilities have to 
navigate fragmented financing and delivery systems that separate 
medical care from LTC services (68). This fragmentation creates 
difficulties because people with disabilities typically have a 
combination of medical and LTC needs. Although a separate LTC 
programme helps to protect funding for LTC services and militates 
against the risk of unnecessary medicalization of LTC services, 
financing fragmentation and misalignment certainly pose challenges 
in efforts towards integrating acute, post-acute and LTC services.

The degree of separation between medical care and LTC services 
varies between countries. In many countries (e.g. Germany, Japan, 
Netherlands (Kingdom of the), Sweden and the USA) LTC is financed 
and organized separately from medical care. In other countries (e.g. 
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Belgium, France, Italy, Portugal, Spain and the United Kingdom) the 
skilled nursing or medical component of home care, and sometimes 
nursing home care, is part of the health care system, while the social 
component is part of the social service system (68).

6.5	 Leveraging government subsidies to 
incentivize LTC provision and access

Few (if any) LMICs currently have comprehensive LTC financing 
systems to ensure universal coverage for people with disabilities in 
need of LTC services. Establishment of such systems, whether built 
on the public social insurance framework or primarily taxation 
based, will take time and resources. Until this stage is reached, 
policy-makers in LMICs may consider using their limited resources in 
various forms of government subsidies to incentivize the 
development of LTCs on the supply side, and to mitigate the lack of 
affordability for LTC services on the demand side. 

6.5.1 	Supply-side subsidies to service providers

In some LMICs (e.g. China) the government (mostly subnational and 
local governments) provides financial inducements for the 
development of LTC facilities by the private sector in the form of 
subsidies for new construction, and ongoing operating subsidies for 
occupied beds (50). In conjunction with other preferential policy 
treatments such as tax exemptions, land allotment or leasing for new 
construction, and reduced utility rates, these subsidies are intended 
to encourage private-sector investment in the development of LTC 
services. These subsidies vary between provinces and are typically 
low relative to facility operating costs. Most of these subsidies are 
aimed at residential care facilities, but in recent years more 
subsidies have been targeted at the development of home- and 
community-based services. In general, these subsidies are not linked 
explicitly to quality of care or other performance standards.

It is important to note that, although these supply-side financial 
inducements may be necessary to stimulate the development of LTC 
services in the early stage, their contribution towards financing the 
recurrent costs of those services is small. These inducements also 
have no influence on the monitoring and enforcement of quality 
standards, and no impact on enabling the government to achieve a 
balance between institutional care and home- and community-
based services (50).

6.5.2 Demand-side subsidies to service users

In LMIC settings, demand-side subsidies (e.g. vouchers and cash 
allowances) can be effective instruments to increase the purchasing 
power of low-income members of the population and those in need 
of LTC who wish to live in their homes for as long as possible (44). 
These types of subsidies can help promote ageing in place if 
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vouchers can be redeemed for home- and community-based 
services. Similar financial incentives can also be provided to support 
informal care provision, for example through cash allowances for 
family caregivers or vouchers that caregivers can redeem for 
services such as respite care.

In China, some local governments provide limited cash allowances or 
service vouchers to all people aged 80 (or 60) years and older or 
other frail older adults in financial hardship without children living 
with them. Although these allowances or vouchers are rarely enough 
(in cash value) to purchase significant amounts of LTC services, they 
do to some degree improve the financial position of older adults at 
high risk of LTC service needs. One appeal of these subsidies is their 
low administrative costs, because individuals do not need to go 
through complicated assessments of their functional capacities and 
needs (68).

There are potential pitfalls associated with cash benefits, such as the 
moral hazard effects of cash payments, particularly in contexts 
where recipients are not required to justify the use of funds (62). In 
these contexts, individuals face few constraints when spending their 
cash allowances on items that the allowances are not intended for 
(e.g. food or other necessities) instead of on LTC services. This 
problem can be mitigated by designing cash benefits that are 
conditional on care budgets or receipts justifying the use of 
allowances (62). However, it should be noted that cash benefits for 
family caregivers may have the unintended consequence of 
perpetuating the traditional inequitable sex and gender roles by 
financially incentivizing women to continue to provide informal care 
(71). Lastly, unregulated cash benefits or vouchers provided to users 
are more likely to boost informal care and the grey markets of care 
mostly provided by domestic helpers (as in countries such as Austria, 
Germany and Italy) rather than generating demand for formal 
services and fostering professionalism in the provision of those 
services (72). 

In summary, both supply-side and demand-side financing incentives 
in the form of government subsidies are needed to bolster the 
development of an LTC system, especially in the early stage of 
development. However, these subsidies alone are not sufficient. 
Policy-makers in LMICs should take steps towards establishing more 
comprehensive approaches to public LTC financing, ideally following 
a broad-based social insurance model providing universal coverage 
for all individuals in need of LTC.
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The potentially high financial burden of LTC, resulting from 
uncertainties surrounding the duration, volume and type of care 
required, has prompted calls for public financing mechanisms to 
complement informal care provision. In HICs, formal systems of 
public LTC financing have been introduced for this purpose, with LTC 
programmes in these countries comprising universal programmes 
financed through taxation and mandatory social health insurance, as 
well as means-tested programmes. This review of publicly funded 
LTC programmes has focused on MICs, for which the current 
evidence is relatively sparse. For the reviewed MICs, countries such 
as China and Thailand have some universal LTC programmes that are 
of limited scope and scale; other countries, including India and 
Malaysia, have limited public programmes predominantly in the form 
of means-tested social welfare. 

Three major types of public LTC programmes commonly exist in the 
reviewed MICs: those in which the government either directly 
provides LTC services or finances LTC programmes through supply-
side or demand-side financing mechanisms; cash allowance 
programmes, which disburse monetary allowances to beneficiaries; 
and insurance-based models of public LTC financing. These different 
approaches to financing LTC services vary by how public funds are 
organized and allocated, as well as the extent of coverage for people 
in need of LTC. There are important considerations when designing 
LTC systems: whether eligibility to publicly funded services should 
be means tested or universal; whether the government provide 
services directly or through the role of a third-party payer, that is, via 
contracts with nongovernmental service providers; and whether the 
finance structure should be centralized or decentralized. Each of 
these design features has both advantages and disadvantages.

This report concludes with some deliberations on financing options 
for LTC, specifically for LMICs. Of the two most common approaches 
to financing LTC, tax-based financing is preferred over a social-
insurance-based model, as the former has two key advantages over 
the latter. Tax financing is more efficient as it pools LTC risks 
(likewise for health risk) across a larger population. Tax financing is 
also more equitable as it ensures that LTC services are accessible to 
individuals who are either not employed or who are employed in the 
informal sector, as well as to formal sector workers covered under 
social insurance. LMICs, and especially LICs, often face constraints in 
raising revenue to finance public programmes and have many 
competing priorities in other areas (e.g. infrastructure and defence). 
The presence of a large informal labour sector, which is common in 
many LICs and in some MICs, would render a social insurance model 
of LTC financing unfeasible. 

The financing of LTC involves complex and multidimensional 
challenges that countries globally will need to confront. In this 
report, the financing models and approaches adopted by different 
countries have been explored, country case studies examined and 
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the implications of these financing choices discussed. This report 
therefore offers valuable insights into how policy-makers can design 
effective and sustainable public LTC financing systems, ensuring that 
individuals and their families receive the necessary support and 
assistance to lead dignified lives as they age.
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